A Member of the International Code Family® %’

TERNATIONAL &
BuUILDING
Copr

2006



2006 International Building Code®

First Printing: January 2006
Second Printing: November 2006
Third Printing: March 2007
Fourth Printing: March 2008
Fifth Printing: January 2009
Sixth Printing: April 2009

ISBN-13: 978-1-58001-251-5 (soft)
ISBN-10: 1-58001-251-5 (soft)
ISBN-13: 978-1-58001-250-8 (loose-leaf)
ISBN-10: 1-58001-250-7 (loose-leaf)
ISBN-13: 978-1-58001-302-4 (e-document)
ISBN-10: 1-58001-302-3 (e-document)

COPYRIGHT © 2006
by
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, INC.

ALL RIGHTS RESERVED. This 2006 International Building Code® is a copyrighted work owned by the International Code Coun-
cil, Inc. Without advance written permission from the copyright owner, no part of this book may be reproduced, distributed, or trans-
mitted in any form or by any means, including, without limitation, electronic, optical or mechanical means (by way of example and
not limitation, photocopying, or recording by or in an information storage retrieval system). For information on permission to copy
material exceeding fair use, please contact: Publications, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478. Phone
1-888-ICC-SAFE (422-7233).

Trademarks: “International Code Council,” the “International Code Council” logo and the “International Building Code” are trade-
marks of the International Code Council, Inc.

PRINTED IN THE U.S.A.



PREFACE

Introduction

Internationally, code officials recognize the need for a modern, up-to-date building code addressing the design and installation of
building systems through requirements emphasizing performance. The International Building Code®, in this 2006 edition, is
designed to meet these needs through model code regulations that safeguard the public health and safety in all communities, large
and small.

This comprehensive building code establishes minimum regulations for building systems using prescriptive and perfor-
mance-related provisions. It is founded on broad-based principles that make possible the use of new materials and new building
designs. This 2006 edition is fully compatible with all the International Codes® (1-Codes®) published by the International Code
Council (ICC)®, including the ICC Electrical Code®, International Energy Conservation Code®, International Existing Building
Code®, International Fire Code®, International Fuel Gas Code®, International Mechanical Code®, ICC Performance Code®, Inter-
national Plumbing Code®, International Private Sewage Disposal Code®, International Property Maintenance Code®, Interna-
tional Residential Code®, International Wildland-Urban Interface Code™ and International Zoning Code®.

The International Building Code provisions provide many benefits, among which is the model code development process that
offers an international forum for building professionals to discuss performance and prescriptive code requirements. This forum pro-
vides an excellent arena to debate proposed revisions. This model code also encourages international consistency in the application
of provisions.

Development

The first edition of the International Building Code (2000) was the culmination of an effort initiated in 1997 by the ICC. This
included five drafting subcommittees appointed by ICC and consisting of representatives of the three statutory members of the
International Code Council at that time, including: Building Officials and Code Administrators International, Inc. (BOCA), Inter-
national Conference of Building Officials (ICBO) and Southern Building Code Congress International (SBCCI). The intent was to
draft a comprehensive set of regulations for building systems consistent with and inclusive of the scope of the existing model codes.
Technical content of the latest model codes promulgated by BOCA, ICBO and SBCCI was utilized as the basis for the development,
followed by public hearings in 1997, 1998 and 1999 to consider proposed changes. This 2006 edition presents the code as originally
issued, with changes reflected in the 2003 edition and further changes approved through the ICC Code Development Process
through 2005. A new edition such as this is promulgated every three years.

This code is founded on principles intended to establish provisions consistent with the scope of a building code that adequately
protects public health, safety and welfare; provisions that do not unnecessarily increase construction costs; provisions that do not
restrict the use of new materials, products or methods of construction; and provisions that do not give preferential treatment to par-
ticular types or classes of materials, products or methods of construction.

Adoption

The International Building Code is available for adoption and use by jurisdictions internationally. Its use within a governmental
jurisdiction is intended to be accomplished through adoption by reference in accordance with proceedings establishing the jurisdic-
tion’s laws. At the time of adoption, jurisdictions should insert the appropriate information in provisions requiring specific local
information, such as the name of the adopting jurisdiction. These locations are shown in bracketed words in small capital letters in
the code and in the sample ordinance. The sample adoption ordinance on page v addresses several key elements of a code adoption
ordinance, including the information required for insertion into the code text.

Maintenance

The International Building Code is kept up to date through the review of proposed changes submitted by code enforcing officials,
industry representatives, design professionals and other interested parties. Proposed changes are carefully considered through an
open code development process in which all interested and affected parties may participate.

The contents of this work are subject to change both through the Code Development Cycles and the governmental body that
enacts the code into law. For more information regarding the code development process, contact the Code and Standard Develop-
ment Department of the International Code Council.

While the development procedure of the International Building Code assures the highest degree of care, ICC, its members and
those participating in the development of this code do not accept any liability resulting from compliance or noncompliance with the
provisions because ICC does not have the power or authority to police or enforce compliance with the contents of this code. Only the
governmental body that enacts the code into law has such authority.

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® iiii



Letter Designations in Front of Section Numbers

In each code development cycle, proposed changes to the code are considered at the Code Development Hearings by the ICC Fire
Code Development Committee, whose action constitutes a recommendation to the voting membership for final action on the pro-
posed change. Proposed changes to a code section that has a number beginning with a letter in brackets are considered by a different
code development committee. For example, proposed changes to code sections that have [F] in front of them (e.g. [F] 903.1.1.1) are
considered by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee at the code development hearings.

The content of sections in this code that begin with a letter designation are maintained by another code development committee in
accordance with the following:

[E] = International Energy Conservation Code Development Committee;
[EB] = International Existing Building Code Development Committee;
[EL] = ICC Electrical Code Development Committee;

[F1 = International Fire Code Development Committee;

[FG] = International Fuel Gas Code Development Committee;

[M] = International Mechanical Code Development Committee; and
[P] = International Plumbing Code Development Committee.

Marginal Markings

Solid vertical lines in the margins within the body of the code indicate a technical change from the requirements of the 2003 edition.
Deletion indicators in the form of an arrow ( = ) are provided in the margin where an entire section, paragraph, exception or table
has been deleted or an item in a list of items or a table has been deleted.

iv 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



ORDINANCE

The International Codes are designed and promulgated to be adopted by reference by ordinance. Jurisdictions wishing to adopt the
2006 International Building Code as an enforceable regulation governing structures and premises should ensure that certain factual
information is included in the adopting ordinance at the time adoption is being considered by the appropriate governmental body.
The following sample adoption ordinance addresses several key elements of a code adoption ordinance, including the information
required for insertion into the code text.

SAMPLE ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance of the [JURISDICTION] adopting the 2006 edition of the International Building Code, regulating and governing the
conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities
and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures in the [JURISDIC-
TION]; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; repealing Ordinance No. of the [JURISDICTION]
and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

The [GOVERNING BODY] of the [JURISDICTION] does ordain as follows:

Section 1.That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the [TITLE OF JURISDICTION’S KEEPER OF
RECORDS] of [NAME OF JURISDICTION], being marked and designated as the International Building Code, 2006 edition, including
Appendix Chapters [FILL IN THE APPENDIX CHAPTERS BEING ADOPTED] (see International Building Code Section 101.2.1, 2006
edition), as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the [JURISDICTION], in
the State of [STATE NAME] for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by
providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures
are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and
use and the demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building Code on file in the office of the
[JURISDICTION] are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, inser-
tions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:
Section 101.1. Insert: [NAME OF JURISDICTION]
Section 1612.3. Insert: [NAME OF JURISDICTION]
Section 1612.3. Insert: [DATE OF ISSUANCE]
Section 3410.2. Insert: [DATE IN ONE LOCATION]

Section 3. That Ordinance No. of [JURISDICTION] entitled [FILL IN HERE THE COMPLETE TITLE OF THE ORDINANCE OR
ORDINANCES IN EFFECT AT THE PRESENT TIME SO THAT THEY WILL BE REPEALED BY DEFINITE MENTION] and all other ordinances
or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional,
such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The [GOVERNING BODY] hereby declares that it
would have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this ordinance or in the Building Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding
impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any
act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be
lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.

Section 6. That the [JURISDICTION’S KEEPER OF RECORDS] is hereby ordered and directed to cause this ordinance to be published.
(An additional provision may be required to direct the number of times the ordinance is to be published and to specify that it is to be
in a newspaper in general circulation. Posting may also be required.)

Section 7. That this ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters established and adopted
hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect [TIME PERIOD] from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® v



vi

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



TABLE OF CONTENTS

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION ............... 1
Section

101 General........ ... i 1
102 Applicability ........ ... . i 1
103 Department of Building Safety................ 2
104  Duties and Powers of Building Official . ........ 2
105 Permits ........... i 3
106  Construction Documents. .................... 5
107  Temporary Structures and Uses ............... 6
108  Fees..........o i 6
109 InspectionS...........c.c.vuiinmeninnnnenen.. 7
110  Certificate of Occupancy..................... 7
111 Service Utilities . .. ..o, 8
112 Boardof Appeals............ ... ... .. .. .... 8
113 Violations............ ... i, 8
114  StopWorkOrder .............. ... .. ...... 9
115  Unsafe Structures and Equipment ............. 9
CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS .......ccoiviienn.. 11
Section

201 General........ ... ... .. i 11
202 Definitions . ........oouiiiiii 11

CHAPTER 3 USE AND OCCUPANCY

CLASSIFICATION ............... 23
Section
301 General....... ... . 23
302  Classification............... ... .. .. ... 23
303 Assembly Group A ... oL 23
304 BusinessGroupB ........ ... ... oL 24
305 Educational GroupE................. ... ... 24
306 Factory GroupF....... ... .. ... ... ... .... 24
307 High-hazard GroupH ...................... 25
308 Institutional Group I ....................... 33
309 Mercantile GroupM .......... ... 34
310 Residential GroupR ........ ... ... ... ..., 34
311  Storage Group S....... ... 35
312  Utility and Miscellaneous Group U . .......... 35

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED
REQUIREMENTS BASED ON

USE AND OCCUPANCY ..........
Section
401 SCOPE oot
402  Covered Mall Buildings ....................
403 High-rise Buildings .. ......................
404  Atriums. ...
405  Underground Buildings.....................
406  Motor-vehicle-related Occupancies .. .........
407 GroupI-2 . ... .
408 GroupI-3 ... ..
409  Motion Picture Projection Rooms ............
410  Stages and Platforms.......................
411  Special Amusement Buildings ...............
412 Aircraft-related Occupancies ................
413 Combustible Storage . .. ....................
414  Hazardous Materials .......................
415  Groups H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4and H-5 ..........
416  Application of Flammable Finishes ...........
417 DryingRooms ......... . ... ... .. ...
418 Organic Coatings . ... .......ovuienenann...
419  GroupI-1,R-1,R-2,R-3....................
420 Hydrogen Cutoff Rooms....................

CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING

HEIGHTS AND AREAS ...........
Section
501 General............ ... ... ...
502 Definitions . .........ooititiiiii
503  General Height and Area Limitations .........
504 Height....... ... ..
505 Mezzanines. ... ........ouiiiiiiii
506 Area Modifications ........................
507  Unlimited Area Buildings...................
508 Mixed Use and Occupancy . .................
509  Special Provisions . .......... ... .. ... ...
CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION......
Section
601 General......... ... .. ..
602  Construction Classification..................

vii



TABLE OF CONTENTS

603

Combustible Material in Type I and 11
Construction. .. ... 86

CHAPTER 7 FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED

CONSTRUCTION ......covvvnennn. 89

Section
701 General.............. i 89
702 Definitions . .......ootiii i 89
703  Fire-resistance Ratings and Fire Tests . ........ 90
704  Exterior Walls ........... ... ... ... ..., 91
705 FireWalls. ... ... .. i 94
706 FireBarriers...............0iiiiiii.. 96
707  Shaft Enclosures ................ ..., 97
708  Fire Partitions. . ......... ... .. ... . .. ... 100
709  Smoke Barriers ............ ... ... 101
710  Smoke Partitions . .............. ... ....... 101
711  Horizontal Assemblies .................... 102
712 Penetrations .............c.veerenenennnn.. 102
713  Fire-resistant Joint Systems . ............... 105
714  Fire-resistance Rating of

Structural Members. . ................... 105
715  Opening Protectives. . ..................... 106
716 Ducts and Air Transfer Openings............ 110
717  Concealed Spaces ...............couu.... 113
718  Fire-resistance Requirements for Plaster. .. ... 115
719  Thermal- and Sound-insulating Materials . . . . . 115
720  Prescriptive Fire Resistance ................ 116
721  Calculated Fire Resistance ................. 136
CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISHES ........... 165
Section
801 General............. ... ... 165
802 Definitions . ... 165
803  Wall and Ceiling Finishes ... ............... 165
804  Interior Floor Finish ...................... 167
805  Combustible Materials in Type I

and IT Construction .. ................... 168
806  Decorative Materials and Trim.............. 168

CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS...171

Section

901 General......... ... ... i 171
902 Definitions . ...........ciiiiii... 171
903  Automatic Sprinkler Systems............... 174
904  Alternative Automatic

viii

Fire-extinguishing Systems. . ............. 178

905  Standpipe Systems. ............. ... 180
906  Portable Fire Extinguishers. ................ 182
907  Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. .......... 182
908  Emergency Alarm Systems................. 189
909  Smoke Control Systems ................... 190
910  Smoke and Heat Vents. .. .................. 197
911 Fire Command Center..................... 199
912  Fire Department Connections. .............. 199
CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS ............ 201
Section

1001 Administration. ..............c.coevueno... 201
1002 Definitions ... .....oovuiiinnnneann... 201
1003 General Means of Egress .................. 202
1004 OccupantLoad. ............ ... ... .. ..... 203
1005 Egress Width . .......... ... .. ... ... .. 204
1006 Means of Egress [llumination. .............. 205
1007 Accessible Means of Egress . ............... 205
1008 Doors, Gates and Turnstiles ................ 207
1009  Stairways ... 212
1010 Ramps. . ...t 214
1011 ExitSigns...........ooiiiiiinn... 216
1012 Handrails ...... ... .. . . . .. 216
1013 Guards ... 217
1014 EXit ACCESS. ..t vi ettt 218
1015 Exit and Exit Access Doorways . ............ 220
1016 Exit Access Travel Distance . ............... 221
1017 Corridors . ... 221
T018 EXIS ..ottt e 223
1019 Number of Exits and Continuity............. 223
1020 Vertical Exit Enclosures ................... 223
1021 Exit Passageways. .......... ..., 225
1022 Horizontal Exits. .. ....................... 225
1023 Exterior Exit Ramps and Stairways .......... 226
1024 ExitDischarge ........... ... .. .. .. ..... 227
1025 Assembly ....... ... i 228
1026 Emergency Escape and Rescue. ............. 232
CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY .........ccutt.. 235
Section

1101 General....... .. ... . ... 235
1102 Definitions . .. ..o ... 235
1103 Scoping Requirements. . ................... 235
1104 AccessibleRoute......................... 236
1105 Accessible Entrances. ..................... 237

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



1106 Parking and Passenger Loading Facilities . . . . . 238
1107 Dwelling Units and Sleeping Units .......... 238
1108 Special Occupancies . ............c..ovn... 241
1109 Other Features and Facilities ............... 243
1110 Signage..........couiniiiniinnnnn.. 247
CHAPTER 12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT ..... 249
Section
1201 General......... ... . i 249
1202 Definitions . .......ovviiin e, 249
1203 Ventilation ........... ...t 249
1204 Temperature Control . ..................... 250
1205 Lighting . ... 250
1206 YardsorCourts ..............ccoviirinn.n. 251
1207 Sound Transmission ...................... 251
1208 Interior Space Dimensions ................. 251
1209 Access to Unoccupied Spaces. .. ............ 252
1210 Surrounding Materials. .. .................. 252
CHAPTER 13 ENERGY EFFICIENCY.......... 253
Section
1301 General........... ... 0., 253
CHAPTER 14 EXTERIOR WALLS ............. 255
Section
1401 General......... ... .. i, 255
1402 Definitions . .......... .o, 255
1403 Performance Requirements................. 255
1404 Materials. ...t 256
1405 Installation of Wall Coverings .............. 256
1406 Combustible Materials on the

Exterior Side of Exterior Walls ........... 260
1407 Metal Composite Materials (MCM).......... 261
CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND

ROOFTOP STRUCTURES........ 263

Section
1501 General........ ... i 263
1502 Definitions . .......ooviintinnennenan.. 263
1503 Weather Protection ....................... 263
1504 Performance Requirements................. 264
1505 Fire Classification . ....................... 265
1506 Materials. ...t 265
1507 Requirements for Roof Coverings ........... 266
1508 RoofInsulation .......................... 274

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

TABLE OF CONTENTS

1509 Rooftop Structures. .......................
1510 Reroofing........ ...,

CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN .........
Section

1601
1602
1603
1604
1605
1606
1607
1608
1609
1610
1611
1612
1613

General........... ... ... ... . ... . ...
Definitions and Notations . . ................
Construction Documents. . .................
General Design Requirements ..............
Load Combinations . . .....................
Dead Loads .......... ... .. ..
LiveLoads . ....... ... . ..
Snow Loads . ......... ... ... . ...
WindLoads .......... ... .. . ..
Soil Lateral Loads . . ......................
RainLoads............. ... ... ... ... ..
FloodLoads............. ... .. ...t
Earthquake Loads ........................

CHAPTER 17 STRUCTURAL TESTS AND
SPECIAL INSPECTIONS

Section

1701
1702
1703
1704
1705
1706
1707
1708
1709
1710
1711
1712
1713
1714
1715

General........... ... . . i
Definitions . .. ... ... .. i
Approvals. ...
Special Inspections .......................
Statement of Special Inspections ............
Contractor Responsibility ..................
Special Inspections for Seismic Resistance. . . .
Structural Testing for Seismic Resistance . . . ..
Structural Observations. . ..................
Design Strengths of Materials ..............
Alternative Test Procedure .................
TestSafeLoad...........................
In-situ Load Tests .. .......... .. ...,
Preconstruction Load Tests.................
Material and Test Standards . ...............

CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS .....
Section

1801
1802
1803
1804

General......... ... . .. . i i
Foundation and Soils Investigations. .........
Excavation, Gradingand Fill ............. ..

Allowable Load-bearing Values of Soils . ... ..



TABLE OF CONTENTS

1805 Footings and Foundations.................. 345
1806 Retaining Walls . ......................... 357
1807 Dampproofing and Waterproofing . .......... 357
1808 Pier and Pile Foundations .. ................ 358
1809 Driven Pile Foundations ................... 363
1810 Cast-in-place Concrete Pile Foundations. . . . .. 366
1811 CompositePiles............ ... ... ... ... 370
1812 Pier Foundations ......................... 370
CHAPTER 19 CONCRETE .......ccvvviinnnn, 373
Section
1901 General......... ... . 373
1902 Definitions . .. ...t 373
1903 Specifications for Tests and Materials .. ...... 373
1904 Durability Requirements. .. ................ 373
1905 Concrete Quality, Mixing and Placing........ 375
1906 Formwork, Embedded Pipes and

Construction Joints . .................... 375
1907 Details of Reinforcement .................. 376
1908 Modifications to ACI 318 .................. 376
1909 Structural Plain Concrete .................. 379
1910 Minimum Slab Provisions.................. 380
1911 Anchorage to Concrete—Allowable

Stress Design . ............ ... 380
1912  Anchorage to Concrete—Strength Design. . . .. 380
1913 Shoterete. .. ..o 381
1914 Reinforced Gypsum Concrete. .............. 382
1915 Concrete-filled Pipe Columns. .............. 382
CHAPTER 20 ALUMINUM......cooiviinennnns 385
Section
2001 General......... ... i 385
2002 Materials. .. ... 385
CHAPTER 21 MASONRY ......ciiiiiiininn.. 387
Section
2101 General........ ... 387
2102 Definitions and Notations . . ................ 387
2103 Masonry Construction Materials ............ 391
2104 Construction. . .........c.co.vuiininennen .. 394
2105 Quality ASSUTANCEe . ..o v vveve e 397
2106 Seismic Design .......... ... ... ... ... 398
2107 Allowable Stress Design................... 400
2108 Strength Design of Masonry................ 400
X

2109 Empirical Design of Masonry............... 401
2110 Glass Unit Masonry....................... 407
2111 Masonry Fireplaces .................... ... 408
2112 Masonry Heaters . ........................ 411
2113 Masonry Chimneys .................co... 411
CHAPTER 22 STEEL ......iviiiiiiinnnennenns 417
Section
2201 General......... ..o 417
2202 Definitions . ......ovviin i 417
2203 Identification and Protection of Steel

for Structural Purposes .................. 417
2204 ConnectionsS .. .........ouvuvienenennenan.. 417
2205 Structural Steel ............ ... ... .. ... 417
2206 SteelJoists . ... 418
2207 Steel Cable Structures..................... 418
2208 Steel Storage Racks....................... 419
2209 Cold-formed Steel ........................ 419

2210 Cold-formed Steel Light-framed Construction . 419

CHAPTER 23 WOOD ......iviiiiiiiiinennnn. 421
Section
2301 General......... ... 421
2302 Definitions . ... 421
2303 Minimum Standards and Quality ............ 422
2304 General Construction Requirements. . ........ 426
2305 General Design Requirements for

Lateral-force-resisting Systems ........... 435
2306 Allowable Stress Design................... 442
2307 Load and Resistance Factor Design . ......... 449
2308 Conventional Light-frame Construction ... ... 449
CHAPTER 24 GLASS AND GLAZING.......... 495
Section
2401 General........ ... ... il 495
2402 Definitions ... ... 495
2403 General Requirements for Glass. ............ 495
2404 Wind, Snow, Seismic and

Dead Loadson Glass .................... 495
2405 Sloped Glazing and Skylights............... 497
2406 Safety Glazing........... ... ... ... ....... 498
2407 Glass in Handrails and Guards .. ............ 500
2408 Glazing in Athletic Facilities ............... 500
2409 Glass in Elevator Hoistway. .. .............. 500

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM BOARD
AND PLASTER ..........ccve...

Section
2501
2502
2503
2504
2505
2506
2507
2508
2509

Inspection. .......... ... ... . . ...
Vertical and Horizontal Assemblies..........
Shear Wall Construction . . .................
Gypsum Board Materials ..................
Lathing and Plastering. .. ..................
Gypsum Construction . ....................

Gypsum Board in Showers and
Water Closets. ... ...

Lathing and Furring for Cement
Plaster (Stucco) . .......... ... ... ... ....

2510

2511
2512
2513

Interior Plaster. . .........................
Exterior Plaster ..........................

Exposed Aggregate Plaster.................

CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC......oivviitiinnnnennns
Section

2601
2602
2603
2604
2605
2606
2607
2608
2609
2610
2611

General........... ... ... . i
Definitions .. ............ . i
Foam Plastic Insulation....................
Interior Finish and Trim ...................
Plastic Veneer. ........... ... ... ... .......
Light-transmitting Plastics . ................
Light-transmitting Plastic Wall Panels........
Light-transmitting Plastic Glazing . ..........
Light-transmitting Plastic Roof Panels .......

Light-transmitting Plastic Skylight Glazing . ..

Light-transmitting Plastic Interior Signs ... ...

CHAPTER 27 ELECTRICAL .........covvvvnnn
Section

2701
2702 Emergency and Standby Power Systems . . . . ..

General......... ... ... . . . . ..

CHAPTER 28 MECHANICAL SYSTEMS .......
Section

2801 General........... .. ... ...

CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS
Section

2901
2902 Minimum Plumbing Facilities

General......... ... . . ... ..

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

TABLE OF CONTENTS

CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND

CONVEYING SYSTEMS.......... 525
Section
3001 General..........cooiiiiiiiii 525
3002 Hoistway Enclosures...................... 525
3003 Emergency Operations .................... 525
3004 Hoistway Venting .............c.ovvvunn.. 526
3005 Conveying Systems ... ..........covvuennn.. 526
3006 Machine Rooms.......................... 527
CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION...... 529
Section
3101 General..........oo i 529
3102 Membrane Structures . .................... 529
3103 Temporary Structures ..................... 530
3104 Pedestrian Walkways and Tunnels . .......... 530
3105 Awnings and Canopies .................... 531
3106 Marquees .. .....cuvunenenennenenennenn. 532
3107 Signs. . ..ot 532
3108 Radio and Television Towers ............... 532
3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and
Safety Devices .. ..., 532
CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS INTO THE
PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY ........ 535
Section
3201 General........ ... 535
3202 Encroachments........................... 535
CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING
CONSTRUCTION .......covvnen. 537
Section
3301 General........ ... 537
3302 Construction Safeguards................... 537
3303 Demolition . ............coiuiiiininan.... 537
3304 SiteWork ....... .. .. i 537
3305 Sanitary ... 537
3306 Protection of Pedestrians. .................. 538
3307 Protection of Adjoining Property............ 539
3308 Temporary Use of Streets, Alleys and
Public Property ............. ... .. ..... 539
3309 Fire Extinguishers ............... .. .. ... .. 539
3310 EXitS o .vvven e 539
3311 Standpipes . .......c.oiiiiiiiiiiii, 539
3312 Automatic Sprinkler System................ 540
Xi



TABLE OF CONTENTS

CHAPTER 34 EXISTING STRUCTURES........ 541
Section

3401 General.......... ... .. i, 541
3402 Definitions . .........viiiiiiiiii.. 541
3403 Additions, Alterations or Repairs............ 541
3404 FireEscapes...........covuiiiinennan.. 542
3405 Glass Replacement ....................... 543
3406 Change of Occupancy ..............ooouo.. 543
3407 Historic Buildings . ......... ... ... .. ... .. 543
3408 Moved Structures. . ..., 543
3409 Accessibility for Existing Buildings ......... 543
3410 Compliance Alternatives. .................. 545
CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS..... 555

APPENDIX A EMPLOYEE QUALIFICATIONS.. 575

Section

A101 Building Official Qualifications............. 575
A102 Referenced Standards ..................... 575
APPENDIX B BOARD OF APPEALS ........... 577
Section

B101 General............. ... ... ... . . . 577

APPENDIX C GROUP U—AGRICULTURAL

BUILDINGS ......covviviienn.n. 579
Section
Cl101 General...... ..., 579
C102 Allowable Height and Area................. 579
C103 Mixed Occupancies .. ...........c.oooeunnn.. 579
Cl04 EXits ...t 579
APPENDIX D FIRE DISTRICTS ............... 581
Section
DIOI General............ ... .. .. .. . .. 581
D102 Building Restrictions. ..................... 581
D103 Changes to Buildings ..................... 582
D104 Buildings Located Partially in the
Fire District . ......... ... .. . ... 582
D105 Exceptions to Restrictions in Fire District. . . . . 582
D106 Referenced Standards ..................... 583

APPENDIX E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY

REQUIREMENTS ............... 585
Section
E101 General......... ... ... . 585
E102 Definitions ... .. ..., 585
xii

E103 AccessibleRoute............... ... .. ..... 585
E104 Special Occupancies ...................... 585
E105 Other Features and Facilities ............... 586
E106 Telephones............ ... .. .. .. ....... 586
EI107 Signage...........oioiiiiininaa.. 587
EIO8 BusStops............oiiiiiiiiiin... 588
E109 Transportation Facilities and Stations ........ 588
E110 AIrports .........ooouiiuiinninennan.. 589
EI11 Referenced Standards ..................... 589
APPENDIX F RODENTPROOFING ............ 591
Section

F101 General........ ... .. .. . . . .. 5901

APPENDIX G FLOOD-RESISTANT

CONSTRUCTION ...ovvvvvnnnnnes 593
Section
G101 Administration. ............ ..., 593
G102 Applicability ......... ... ... ... ... .. ... 593
G103 PowersandDuties........................ 593
G104 Permits .. ...t 594
G105 Variances ...........ouiuiiniineenennan.. 594
G201 Definitions . ..., 595
G301 Subdivisions. ......... ..., 596
G401 Site Improvement. ........... ... ... ....... 596
G501 Manufactured Homes ..................... 596
G601 Recreational Vehicles ..................... 596
G701 Tanks ........ ..o, 597
G801 Other Building Work...................... 597
G901 Referenced Standards ..................... 597
APPENDIX H SIGNS. ...ttt iiiiiiiennennns 599
Section
H101 General........... ... ..o, 599
H102 Definitions . ..., 599
H103 Location..............coiiiiirininnnnan.. 599
H104 Identification ......... ... ... .. ... ....... 599
H105 Design and Construction. .................. 600
H106 Electrical .......... .. ... ... .. ... 600
H107 Combustible Materials .................... 600
H108 Animated Devices ........................ 600
H109 Ground Signs.......... ..., 600
HI10 RoofSigns......... ... ... ... .. .. ... .. 601
HI11 WallSigns ... ... 601
HI112 Projecting Signs. ........... .. ... ......... 601

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



HI113 Marquee Signs..........coouiiiininann... 602
H114 Portable Signs .............c. i, 602
H115 Referenced Standards ..................... 602
APPENDIX 1T PATIO COVERS........ccevveuns 603
Section

1101 General........... .. .. .. i, 603
1102 Definitions . ..., 603
[103  Exterior Openings . ...........c...ueuvnnn.. 603
1104  Structural Provisions...................... 603
APPENDIXJ GRADING.........ccovvvvnnnnn. 605
JIO1 General........ ... i 605
J102 Definitions .. ....... ..o 605
J 103 Permits Required .. ....................... 605
J104 Permit Application and Submittals. .......... 605
JIO5 InspectionS.............oouiniiinenenennn.. 606
JI06 Excavations .............c.ooviereninnnn... 606
JI07 Fills. ... ..o 607
JIO8 Setbacks.........c.coiiii 607
J109 Drainage and Terracing. ................... 607
JI10 ErosionControl .......................... 608
JI11 Referenced Standards ..................... 608
APPENDIX K ICC ELECTRICAL CODE........ 609
INDEX . i iiiiiiiineenrecnonssesosnssasnsnnas 637

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

TABLE OF CONTENTS

xiii



Xiv 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



CHAPTER 35
REFERENCED STANDARDS

This chapter lists the standards that are referenced in various sections of this document. The standards are listed herein by the
promulgating agency of the standard, the standard identification, the effective date and title, and the section or sections of this
document that reference the standard. The application of the referenced standards shall be as specified in Section 102.4.

AA

Aluminum Association
900 - 19th Street N.W., Suite 300
‘Washington, DC 20006

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ADM 1—00 Aluminum Design Manual: Part 1-A Aluminum Structures, Allowable Stress Design; and Part 1-B—
Aluminum Structures, Load and Resistance Factor Design of Buildings and Similar Type Structures. . . . . . 1604.3.5, 2002.1
ASM 35—00 Aluminum Sheet Metal Work in Building Construction (Fourth Edition) . .......... ... ... ... ... ... .. . ... 2002.1
American Architectural Manufacturers Association
1827 Waldon Office Square, Suite 550
Schaumburg, IL 60173
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
1402—86 Standard Specifications for Aluminum Siding, Soffit and Fascia .. ........ .. ... ... 1404.5.1
101/1.S.2/A440—05 Specifications for Windows, Doors and Unit Skylights . .. ............ . i 1714.5.1, 2405.5
American Concrete Institute
P.O. Box 9094
Farmington Hills, MI 48333-9094
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
216.1—97 Standard Method for Determining Fire Resistance of Concrete and
Masonry Construction ASSEMDbIIES . . . . ...ttt s Table 720.1(2), 721.1
318—05 Building Code Requirements for Structural Concrete . . .. 1604.3.2, Table 1704.3, 1704.4.1, Table 1704.4, 1708.3, 1805.4.2.6,
1805.9, 1808.2.23.1.1, 1808.2.23.2,1808.2.23.2.1, 1809.2.2.2.2,
1809.2.3.2, 1809.2.3.2.2, 1810.1.2.2, 1812.8,1901.2, 1901.3, 1901.4, 19021,
1903.1, 1904.1, 1904.2.1, 1904.2.2, 1904.2.3, 1904.3, 1904.4, 1905.1.1, 1905.2,
1905.3, 1905.4, 1905.5, 1905.6.2, 1905.6.3, 1905.6.4, 1905.6.5, 1905.7, 1905.8, 1905.9,
1905.10, 1905.11, 1905.12, 1905.13, 1906.1, 1906.2, 1906.3, 1906.4, 1907.1, 1907.2, 1907.3,
1907.4, 1907.5, 1907.6, 1907.7.1, 1907.7.2, 1907.7.3, 1907.7.4, 1907.7.5, 1907.8, 1907.9, 1907.10,
1907.11, 1907.12, 1907.13, 1908, 1908.1, 1908.1.1, 1908.1.2, 1908.1.3, 1908.1.4, 1908.1.5, 1908.1.6,
1908.1.7, 1908.1.8, 1908.1.9, 1908.1.10, 1908.1.11, 1908.1.12, 1908.1.13, 1908.1.14, 1908.1.15,
1908.1.16, 1909.1, 1909.3, 1909.4, 1909.5, 1909.6,1912.1, 2108.3, 2205.3
530—05 Building Code Requirements for Masonry Structures. . . ..............coouvenien. .. 1405.5, 1405.5.2, 1405.9, 1604.3.4,
1704.5, 1704.5.1, Table 1704.5.1, 1704.5.2, 1704.5.3,
Table 1704.5.3, 1708.1.1, 1708.1.2, 1708.1.3, 1708.1.4, 1805.5.2, 1812.7,
2101.2.2,2101.2.3,2101.2.4,2101.2.5,2101.2.6, 2103.13.6, 2106.1, 2106.1.1,
2106.1.1.1, 2106.1.1.2, 2106.1.1.3, 2106.3, 2106.4, 2106.5, 2106.6, 2107.1, 2107.2,
2107.3,2107.4, 2107.5, 2107.6, 2107.7, 2107.8 2108.1, 2108.2,2108.3, 2108.4, 2109.1, 2109.2.3.1, 2109.7.3
530.1—05 Specifications for Masonry Structures . ..................c..oo.. .. 1405.5.1, Table 1704.5.1, Table 1704.5.3,2103.13.7,

2104.1,2104.1.1,2104.3,2104.4

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 555



REFERENCED STANDARDS

AF&PA

American Forest & Paper Association
1111 19th St, NW Suite 800

Washington, DC 20036
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
WCD No. 4—89 Wood Construction Data—Plank and Beam Framing for Residential Buildings .. .............. .. .. ... ..... 2306.1.2
WFCM—O01 Wood Frame Construction Manual for One- and Two-family Dwellings .. .......... ... ... .... 2301.2, 2308.1, 2308.2.1
T.R. No. 7—87 Technical Report—Basic Requirements for Permanent Wood Foundation System. . ............. 1805.4.6, 1807.2,2304.9.5
NDS—O05 National Design Specification (NDS) for Wood Construction with 2005 Supplement. . ................ 721.6.3.2,1715.1.1,
1715.1.4, 1805.4.5, 1809.1.4,
2302.1, 2304.12, 2306.1, 2306.2.1, 2306.3.1, Table 2306.3.1, Table 2306.3.2,
Table 2306.4.1, Table 2306.4.4, 2306.3.4, 2306.3.5, 2306.4.1,2307.1, 2307.1.1
AF&PA—93 Span Tables for Joists and Rafters. ... ........... i 2306.1.1,2308.8, 2308.10.2, 2308.10.3
SDPWS—05 AF&PA Supplement Special Design Provisions for Wind and Seismic. . .......... ... ... . i 2305.1
American Hardwood Association
l l 1210 West N.W. Highway
Palatine, IL 60067
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
A135.4—2004 Basic Hardboard. . . ... ... 1404.3.1, 2303.1.6
A135.5—2004 Prefinished Hardboard Paneling. . . ... ... .. . 2303.1.6, 2304.6.2
A135.6—1998 Hardboard Siding . . ... ..... ... 1404.3.2, 2303.1.6

AISC

American Institute of Steel Construction
One East Wacker Drive, Suite 3100
Chicago, IL 60601-2001

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
341—05 Seismic Provisions for Structural Steel Buildings,

including Supplement No. 1 dated 2006. ................ 1613.6.2, 1707.2, 1708.4, 2205.2.1, 2205.2.2, 2205.3, 2205.3.1
360—05 Specification for Structural Steel Buildings. . ............... 1604.3.3, Table 1704.3, 2203.2, 2205.1, 2205.3

American Iron and Steel Institute
1140 Connecticut Avenue

Suite 705
Washington, DC 20036
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
NAS—O1 North American Specification for the Design of Cold-formed Steel Structural Members,
including 2004 Supplement . . . ...... ... 1604.3.3, 2209.1, 2210.1
General—04 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—General Provisions. . ........ ... ... .. .. ... 1604.3.3, 2210.1
Header—04 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—Header Design .. ......... . i e 2210.2
Lateral—04 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—Lateral Design .. .......... ... i 2210.5
PM—O01 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—Prescriptive Method for One- and Two-family Dwellings,
including 2004 SUPPIEMENL. . . . . .ottt ettt e e e e e 2210.6
Truss—04 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—Truss Design . ............ ... .. 1604.3.3, 2210.3
WSD—04 Standard for Cold-formed Steel Framing—Wall Stud Design.......... ... ... . i 2210.4

556

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



AITC

REFERENCED STANDARDS

American Institute of Timber Construction
Suite 140

7012 S. Revere Parkway

Englewood, CO 80112

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
AITC Technical
Note 7—96 Calculation of Fire Resistance of Glued Laminated Timbers. . ... ... 721.6.3.3
AITC 104—03 Typical Construction DetailS. . . . ... ... 2306.1
AITC 110—01 Standard Appearance Grades for Structural Glued Laminated Timber . ............ ... ... . ... . ... ... 2306.1
AITC 113—01 Standard for Dimensions of Structural Glued Laminated Timber . .............. ... ... ... ... . i, 2306.1
AITC 117—04 Standard Specifications for Structural Glued Laminated Timber of Softwood Species. ........................... 2306.1
AITC 119—96 Standard Specifications for Structural Glued Laminated Timber of Hardwood Species. ... .......... ... ... ..... 2306.1
AITC 200—04 Manufacturing Quality Control Systems Manual for Structural Glued Laminated Timber. . ....................... 2306.1
ANSI/AITC A 190.1—02 Structural Glued Laminated Timber . . . ... ... .. . 2303.1.3, 2306.1
Automotive Lift Institute
P.O. Box 85
Courtland, NY 13045
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ALI ALCTV—98 Standard for Automotive Lifts—Safety Requirements for Construction, Testing and Validation (ANSI) ............. 3001.2
American National Standards Institute
25 West 43rd Street, Fourth Floor
New York, NY 10036
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
A13.1—96
(Reaffirmed 2002) Scheme for the Identification of Piping Systems . . ... ... ... e 415.8.6.4
A108.1A—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile in the Wet-set Method, with Portland Cement Mortar .. ............ ... ... ........ 2103.10
A108.1B—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile, quarry Tile on a Cured Portland Cement Mortar Setting Bed
with Dry-set or Latex-portland MOTtar . . . ... ... ... e e e 2103.10
A108.4—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile with Organic Adhesives or Water-cleanable Tile-setting Epoxy Adhesive ............ 2103.10.6
A108.5—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile with Dry-set Portland Cement Mortar or Latex-portland Cement Mortar . ............ 2103.9.3,
2103.10.1, 2103.10.2
A108.6—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile with Chemical-resistant, Water Cleanable Tile-setting and -grouting Epoxy .......... 2103.10.3
A108.8—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile with Chemical-resistant Furan Resin Mortar and Grout .......................... 2103.10.4
A108.9—99 Installation of Ceramic Tile with Modified Epoxy Emulsion Mortar/Grout. . .. ........couuuieuniineennenn.. 2103.10.5
A108.10—99 Installation of Groutin Tilework . . ... ... 2103.10.7
A118.1—99 American National Standard Specifications for Dry-set Portland Cement Mortar. . .................cooouu..... 2103.10.1
A118.3—99 American National Standard Specifications for Chemical-resistant, Water-cleanable Tile-setting and
-grouting Epoxy and Water Cleanable Tile-setting Epoxy Adhesive . ............. ... ... .. ... ... 2103.10.3
A118.4—99 American National Standard Specifications for Latex-portland Cement Mortar .. .......... ... ... ... ... ... 2103.10.2
A118.5—99 American National Standard Specifications for Chemical Resistant Furan Mortar and
Grouts for Tile Installation. . . ... . 2103.10.4
A118.6—99 American National Standard Specifications for Cement Grouts for Tile Installation. .......................... 2103.10.7
A118.8—99 American National Standard Specifications for Modified Epoxy Emulsion Mortar/Grout ... ................... 2103.10.5
A136.1—99 American National Standard Specifications for Organic Adhesives for Installation of Ceramic Tile .............. 2103.10.6
A137.1—88 American National Standard Specifications for Ceramic Tile . ........ .. .. ... i i 2103.5
A208.1—99 Particleboard . . ... ... 2303.1.7,2303.1.7.1
7 97.1—84 (R1994) Safety Glazing Materials Used in Buildings—Safety Performance Specifications and
Methods of Test (Reaffirmed 1994) . . ... ... . e et e 2406.1.2, 2409.1

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 557



REFERENCED STANDARDS

APA

APA - Engineered Wood Association
P.O. Box 11700
Tacoma, WA 98411-0700

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
APA PDS—04 Panel Design Specification . . .. ... ... . 2306.1, 2306.3.1, 2306.4.1
APA PDS
Supplement 1—90 Design and Fabrication of Plywood Curved Panels (revised 1995) . ........ ... ... ... . . i .. 2306.1
APA PDS
Supplement 2—92 Design and Fabrication of Plywood-lumber beams (revised 1998) .. ... ... .. i 2306.1
APA PDS
Supplement 3—90 Design and Fabrication of Plywood Stressed-skin Panels (revised 1996) .......... ... ... ... . i ... 2306.1
APA PDS
Supplement 4—90 Design and Fabrication of Plywood Sandwich Panels (revised 1993) . ... ... . ... i 2306.1
APA PDS
Supplement 5—95 Design and Fabrication of All-plywood Beams (revised 1995) ... ... .. i 2306.1
EWS R540—96 Builders Tips: Proper Storage and Handling of Glulam Beams. .. ....... . .. . i i 2306.1
EWS S475—01 Glued Laminated Beam Design Tables. . . ... ..o 2306.1
EWS S560—03 Field Notching and Drilling of Glued Laminated Timber Beams ............... ... ... ... ... ... ... ... ..... 2306.1
EWS T300—02 Glulam Connection DetailS. . . .. ...ttt e e e e e e 2306.1
EWS X440—00 Product Guide—GIulam . . . ... ... o 2306.1
EWS X450—01 Glulam in Residential Construction —Western Edition. . ........ ... ... .. . i 2306.1
American Society of Agricultural Engineers
A S AE 2950 Niles Road
St. Joseph, MI 49085-9659
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
EP 484.2 (1998) Diaphragm Design of Metal-clad, Post-frame Rectangular Buildings. . .......... ... ... ... ... . .. 2306.1
EP 486.1 (2000) Shallow-post Foundation Design . . . .. ...t e 2306.1
EP 559 (1997) Design Requirements and Bending Properties for Mechanically Laminated Columns. .. .......... ... ... ... .... 2306.1
American Society of Civil Engineers
Structural Engineering Institute
AS C l C /S I C I 1801 Alexander Bell Drive
Reston, VA 20191-4400
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
3—91 Structural Design of Composite Slabs. .. ... ... ... 1604.3.3, 2209.2
5—05 Building Code Requirements for Masonry Structures. . .............. 1405.5, 1405.5.2, 1405.9, 1604.3.4, 1704.5, 1704.5.1,
Table 1704.5.1, 1704.5.2, 1704.5.3, Table 1704.5.3, 1708.1.1,
1708.1.2, 1708.1.3,1708.1.4, 1805.5.2, 1812.7,2101.2.2, 2101.2.3,
2101.2.4,2101.2.5,2101.2.6, 2103.13.6, 2106.1, 2106.1.1, 2106.1.1.1, 2106.1.1.2,
2106.1.1.3, 2106.3, 2106.4, 2106.5, 2106.6, 2107.1, 2107.2,2107.3, 2107 .4,
2107.5,2107.6, 2107.7, 2170.8, 2108.1, 2108.2,2108.3, 2108.4, 2109.1, 2109.2.3.1,2109.7.3
6—05 Specifications for Masonry Structures .. .............c..coouuienneenneennen.. 1405.5.1, Table 1704.5.1, Table 1704.5.3,
1805.5.2.2,2103.13.7, 2104.1, 2104.1.1, 2104.3,2104.4
7—05 Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures including
Supplement No. 1 and excluding Chapter 14 and Appendix 11A ............. 1602.1, 1604.3, 1604.10, 1605.1, 1605.2.2,
1605.3.1.2, 1605.3.2, 1605.4, 1607.11.1, 1608.1,
1608.2, 1609.1.1, 1609.1.2, 1609.3, 1609.5.1, 1609.5.3, 1611.2,
1612.2,1613.1, 1613.2, Table 1613.5.3(1), Table 1613.5.3(2), 1613.5.6,
1613.5.6.1, 1613.5.6.2, 1613.6, 1613.6.1, 1613.6.2, 1801.2.1, 1802.2.7,
2205.2.1, 2205.3, 2205.3.1, 2208.1, 2305.1.5, 2305.2.5, 2305.3.1, 2306.4.5,
Table 2306.4.5, Table 2308.10.1
8—02 Standard Specification for the Design of Cold-formed Stainless Steel Structural Members. ............... 1604.3.3, 2209.1
19—96 Structural Applications of Steel Cables for Buildings. .. .......... i i 2207.1, 2207.2
24—05 Flood Resistant Design and COnstruction. . . ... .....ouuvtu ettt 1203.3.2,1612.4, 1612.5, 3001.2
29—05 Standard Calculation Methods for Structural Fire Protection. . ............. . e 721.1
32—01 Design and Construction of Frost Protected Shallow Foundations . .. .......... ... ... .. ... 1805.2.1
558 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



ASME

REFERENCED STANDARDS

American Society of Mechanical Engineers
Three Park Avenue
New York, NY 10016-5990

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
A17.1—04 Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators with A17.1a-2005 addenda and

A17.1S Supplement 2005 . .. ............. 1007.4, 1607.8.1, 3001.2, 3001.4, 3002.5,3003.2, 3409.8.2
A18.1—03 Safety Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts .. ............................... 1109.7,2702.2.6, 3409.8.3
A90.1—03 Safety Standard for Belt Manlifts . . ... ... ... 3001.2
A112.18.19.8M—1987 Suction Fittings for Use in Swimming Pools, Wading Pools, Spas, Hot Tubs and

Whirlpool Bathing APplIances. . . . .. ..ottt et e et e e e e e e e e e e e 3109.5.1
A112.19.17—2002 Manufactured Safety Vacuum Release Systems (SVRS) for Residential and

Commercial Swimming Pool, Spa, Hot Tub and Wading Pool . . ........ .. ... ... .. i 3109.5.2
B16.18—2001 Cast Copper Alloy Solder Joint Pressure Fittings. . ... ... ..ot e 909.13.1
B16.22—2001 Wrought Copper and Copper Alloy Solder Joint Pressure Fittings. . .......... ... ... ... i ... 909.13.1
B20.1—2003 Safety Standard for Conveyors and Related Equipment . ......... ... .. ... i 3001.2, 3005.3
B31.3—2002 ProCess PIping . . . oo 415.8.6.1

ASTM International
A S' I ‘M 100 Barr Harbor Drive
‘West Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
A 6/A 6M— 04a Specification for General Requirements for Rolled Steel, Structural Steel Bars,

Plates, Shapes, and Sheet Piling . . . ... ... Table 1704.3
A 36/A 36M—04 Specification for Carbon Structural Steel. . . ... ... .. 1809.3.1, 2103.13.5
A 82—02 Specification for Steel Wire, Plain, for Concrete Reinforcement . ............. ... ... ... ... ... 2103.13.5, 2103.13.6
A 123/A 123M—02 Specification for Zinc (Hot-dip Galvanized) Coating on Iron and Steel Products. .. .......... ... ... ... .... 2103.13.7.2
A 153—03 Specification for Zinc Coating (Hot-dip) on Iron and Steel Hardware. .. .......................... 2103.13.7.2,2304.9.5
A 185—02 Specification for Steel Welded Wire Reinforcement, Plain for Concrete . .. .......... ... ... ... ... 2103.13.4,2103.13.5
A 240—04 Standard Specification for Chromium and Chromium-nickel Stainless Steel Plate,

Sheet and Strip for Pressure Vessels and for General Applications . ...................... Table 1507.4.3(1), 2103.13.5
A 252—98 (2002) Specification for Welded and Seamless Steel Pipe Piles. .. ...... ... ... ... ... ... ... ... 1809.3.1, 1810.6.1, 1810.8.2
A 283/A 283M—03 Specification for Low and Intermediate Tensile Strength Carbon Steel Plates. ... ..................... 1809.3.1, 1810.6.1
A 307—03 Specification for Carbon Steel Bolts and Studs, 60,000 psi Tensile Strength .. ........................ 1911.1, 2103.13.5
A 416/A 416M—02 Specification for Steel Strand, Uncoated Seven-wire for Prestressed Concrete. .. ................... 1809.2.3.1, 2103.13.6
A 421/A 421M—02 Specification for Uncoated Stress-relieved Steel Wire for Prestressed Concrete .. .........cooveienn ... 2103.13.6
A 435/A 435M—
90 (2001) Specification for Straight-beam Ultrasonic Examination of Steel Plates. . .......... .. ... ... .. . ... 1708.4
A 463/A 463M—02a Specification for Steel Sheet, Aluminum-coated, by the Hot Dip Process. .. .......... ... ... ... ..... Table 1507.4.3(2)
A 480/A480M—02 Specification for General Requirements for Flat-rolled Stainless and Heat-resisting Steel

Plate, Sheet, and SHrIP . . . ..ottt 2103.13.5
A 496—02 Specification for Steel Wire, Deformed for Concrete Reinforcement. . .......... ... .. ... ... ... .. ... 2103.13.3
A 497—01 Specification for Steel Welded Reinforcement Deformed, for Concrete. . .. ..., 2103.13.4
A 510—03 Specification for General Requirements for Wire Rods and Coarse Round Wire, Carbon Steel .................. 2103.13.6
A 568/A 568M—03 Specification for Steel, Sheet, Carbon, and High-strength, Low-alloy, Hot-rolled and

Cold-rolled, General Requirements fOr. .. ... ... ... e Table 1704.3
A 572/A 572M—04 Specification for High-strength Low-alloy Columbium-vanadium Structural Steel. ............. ... ... ... ... 1809.3.1
A 588/A 588M—04 Specification for High-strength Low-alloy Structural Steel with 50 ksi (345 Mpa)

Minimum Yield Point to 4 inches (100 mm) Thick. . . ... ... ... e 1809.3.1
A 615/A 615M—04a Specification for Deformed and Plain Billet-steel Bars for

Concrete Reinforcement . . ... ... i 1708.3, 1810.8.2, 1908.1.5, 2103.13.1, 2103.13.6
A 641/A 641M—03 Specification for Zinc-coated (Galvanized) Carbon Steel Wire . .. ... . i 2103.13.7.1
A 653/A 653M—04a Specification for Steel Sheet, Zinc-coated Galvanized or Zinc-iron Alloy-coated

Galvannealed by the Hot-dip Process ............ ... ... ... ..... Table 1507.4.3(1), Table 1507.4.3(2), 2103.13.7.1
A 690—00a Standard Specification for High Strength Low-alloy Steel H-piles and Sheet Piling for

Use in Marine EnVIrONMENtS . . . . . ..ottt e ettt e e e e e e e s 1809.3.1
A 706/A 706M—04a Specification for Low-alloy Steel Deformed and

Plain Bars for Concrete Reinforcement . ................ 1704.4.1, Table 1704.3, 1908.1.5, 2103.13.1, 2103.13.6, 2108.3

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 559



REFERENCED STANDARDS

A 722/A 722M—
98 (2003)

A 755/A 755M—04

A 767/A 767TM—00b
A T75/A TT5M—04
A 792/A 792M—03

A 875/A 875M—02a
A 884—02

A 898/A 898M—
91 (2001)

A 899—91 (2002)
A 913/A 913M—04

A924—04

A951—02
A 992—04a
A 996/A 996M—04

A1008/A1008M—04b

B 42—02e01
B 43—04

B 68—02

B 88—03

B 101—02

B 209—04
B 251—02e01
B 280—03
B 370—03

B 695—00
C5—03

C 22/C 22M—00
C 27—98 (2002)
C 28/C 28M—00e01
C 31/31M—03a
C33—03
C34—03

C 35—95 (2001)
C 36/C 36M—03
C 37/C 37TM—01
C 55—03

C 56—96 (2001)
C 59/C 59M—00
C61/C 61M—00
C 62—04

C 67—03ae01

C73—99a
C79—04a

C 90—03
C91—03a

C 94/C 94M—04
C109/C109M—02

C 126—99
C 140—03

560

ASTM—continued

Specification for Uncoated High-strength Steel Bar for Prestressing Concrete ............ 1810.8.2,2103.13.6, 2106.1.1.3.1
Specification for Steel Sheet, Metallic-coated by the Hot-dip Process and Prepainted by the
Coil-coating Process for Exterior Exposed Building Products. ...................... Table 1507.4.3(1), Table 1507.4.3(2)
Specification for Zinc-coated (Galvanized) Steel Bars for Concrete Reinforcement . .. ........................ 2103.13.1
Specification for Epoxy-coated Steel Reinforcing Bars . ....... ... .. . i 2103.13.1
Specification for Steel Sheet, 55% Aluminum-zinc Alloy-coated by the
HOt-dip Process . . . .. oot Table 1507.4.3(1), Table 1507.4.3(2)
Standard Specification for Steel Sheet Zinc-5 percent, Aluminum Alloy-coated by the Hot-dip Process. . . . . Table 1507.4.3(2)
Specification for Epoxy-coated Steel Wire and Welded Wire Fabric for Reinforcement ...................... 2103.13.7.3
Specification for Straight Beam Ultrasonic Examination of Rolled Steel Shapes. ... ......... ... ... ... ....... 1708.4
Specification for Steel Wire Epoxy-coated. . ... ... ... . 2103.13.7.3
Specitfication for High-strength Low-alloy Steel Shapes of Structural Quality,
Produced by Quenching and Self-tempering Process (QST). ... ...ttt 1809.3.1
Standard Specification for General Requirements for Steel Sheet, Metallic-coated by
the HOt-dip ProCess. . . . . ..ottt e Table 1507.4.3(1)
Specification for Masonry Joint Reinforcement . ... ... ... .. e 2103.13.2
Standard Specification for Structural Shapes. . . .. ... ... e 1809.3.1
Specification for Rail-steel and Axle-steel Deformed Bars for
Concrete ReinforCement. . . ... ... it e e 2103.13.1, 2103.13.6
Specification for Steel, Sheet, Cold-rolled, Carbon, Structural, High-strength Low-alloy and
High-strength Low-alloy with Improved Formability . .......... ... ... . . i 2103.13.5
Specification for Seamless Copper Pipe, Standard Sizes ... ..... ... ... i 909.13.1
Specification for Seamless Red Brass Pipe, Standard Sizes . ........ ... ... ... ... . . i 909.13.1
Specification for Seamless Copper Tube, Bright Annealed (Metric) ........... ... ... i, 909.13.1
Specification for Seamless Copper Water Tube. . .. .. ... i e 909.13.1
Specification for Lead-coated Copper Sheet and Strip for Building Construction . .. .......... ... ... ..... Table 1404.5.3
Table 1507.4.3(1), Table 1507.2.9.2
Specification for Aluminum and Aluminum Alloy Steel and Plate . ......... ... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 1507.4.3(1)
Specification for General Requirements for Wrought Seamless Copper and Copper-alloy Tube. .. ................ 909.13.1
Specification for Seamless Copper Tube for Air Conditioning and Refrigeration Field Service . . ................. 909.13.1
Specification for Cold-rolled Copper Sheet and Strip for
Building Construction. . .. .....o.t ittt 1404.5.2, Table 1507.2.9.2, Table 1507.4.3(1)
Standard Specification for Coatings of Zinc Mechanically Deposited on Iron and Steel. .. ........... ... ... ... 2304.9.5
Specification for Quicklime for Structural Purposes ... ... ..... ...t Table 2507.2
Specification for GYPSUIN . . . . . ..ottt ettt e e e Table 2506.2
Specification for Standard Classification of Fireclay and High-alumina Refractory Brick .................. 2111.5,2111.8
Specification for Gypsum PIasters . ... ... ... ... e Table 2507.2
Practice for Making and Curing Concrete Test Specimens inthe Field. ......... ... ... ... ... ... ...... Table 1704.4
Specification for CONnCrete AGEreZates. . . . . ..o v vttt et e e e e e e e 721.3.1.4,721.4.1.1.3
Specification for Structural Clay Load-bearingWall Tile ........... ... ... ... .. 2103.2
Specification for Inorganic Aggregates for Use in Gypsum Plaster. . .......... ... ... ... ... .. .......... Table 2507.2
Specification for Gypsum Wallboard . ........... ... ... ... ....... Figure 721.5.1(2), Figure 721.5.1(3), Table 2506.2
Specification for Gypsum Lath . . .. ... o e Table 2507.2
Specification for Concrete Brick. ....... ... .. . Table 721.3.2, 2103.1, 2105.2.2.1.2
Specification for Structural Clay Non-load Bearing Tile . . ... ... .. o 2103.2
Specification for Gypsum Casting and Molding Plaster. . .. ........... . e Table 2507.2
Specification for Gypsum Keene’s CemMeNt . ... .. ... ...ttt e e Table 2507.2
Specification for Building Brick (Solid Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale) ................... 2103.2,2105.2.2.1.1
Test Methods of Sampling and Testing Brick and Structural Clay Tile . . ......... ... ... ... ... ... 721.4.1.1.1, 2104.5,
2105.2.2.1.1,2109.8.1.1
Specification for Calcium Silicate Face Brick (Sand-lime Brick) .................. ... ... ... ... Table 721.3.2, 2103.1
Specification for Treated Core and Nontreated Core Gypsum Sheathing Board . .. ...... ... ... ... ... . ... Table 2506.2
Specification for Loadbearing Concrete Masonry Units .. ................. Table 721.3.2, 1805.5.2.2, 2103.1, 2105.2.2.1.2
Specification for Masonry Cement . .......... ...ttt Table 2103.8(1), Table 2507.2
Specification for Ready-mixed CONCIELE. . . . .. ...ttt e e e e e e e e 109.3.1
Standard Test Method for Compressive Strength of Hydraulic Cement Mortars
(Using 2-in. or [SO-mm] Cube SPECIMENS) . . . . . vt vttt ettt e e e e e e e e e e e 2103.11.1
Specification for Ceramic Glazed Structural Clay Facing Tile, Facing Brick, and Solid Masonry Units . ............. 2103.2
Test Method Sampling and Testing Concrete Masonry Units and Related Units. .. ................. 721.3.1.2,2105.2.2.1.2

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



C 150—04

C 172—04

C 199—84 (2000)
C206—03
C207—04

C 208—95 (2001)
C212—00
C216—04a

C 270—04
C315—02

C 317/C 317M—00
C 330—04
C331—04

C 406—00

C 442/C 442M—04
C 472— 99 (2004)

C 473—03
C 474—02
C 475—01
C 476—02
C 503—03
C514—01

C516—02
C 547—03
C 549—02
C 552—03
C 557—03
C 568—03
C 578—04
C 587—02
C 588/C 588M—01
C 595—03
C615—03
C616—03
C 629—03
C 630/C 630M—03
C 631—95a (2000)
C 635—00

C 636—04
C 645—04
C 652—04a
C 728—97"
C 744—99
C 754—04

C 836—03

C 840—04

C 841—03

C 842—99

C 843—99¢01

C 844—99

C 847—00

C 887—79a (2001)
C 897—00

REFERENCED STANDARDS

ASTM—continued

Specification for Portland Cement. . . ... .. Table 2103.8(1), Table 2507.2
Practice for Sampling Freshly Mixed CONCIELE . . . .. ...ttt ettt e et e e e e Table 1704.4
Test Method for Pier Test for Refractory Mortars . ......... ... i, 2111.5,2111.8,2113.12
Specification for Finishing Hydrated Lime. . . ... ... ... e Table 2507.2
Specification for Hydrated Lime for Masonry Purposes .. ........ ... i Table 2103.8(1)
Specification for Cellulosic Fiber Insulating Board . .. ....... .. ... ... ... .. .. Table 1508.2, 2303.1.5
Specification for Structural Clay Facing Tile . .. ... ... o 2103.2
Specification for Facing Brick (Solid Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale) ........... 1805.5.2.2,2103.2,2105.2.2.1.1
Specification for Mortar for Unit Masonry . . ...ttt 2103.8, Table 2103.8(2)
Specification for Clay Flue Linings . . . . ... ... e 2113.11.1, Table 2113.16(1)
Specification for Gypsum CONCTELE . . . . ... ...ttt ettt ettt e e e e e e e e e e e 1914.1
Specification for Lightweight Aggregates for Structural CONCrete . . .. ...ttt 721.1.1
Specification for Lightweight Aggregates for Concrete Masonry Units .............. ... ... 721.3.1.4,721.4.1.1.3
Specification for Roofing SIate . . ... ... 1507.7.4
Specification for Gypsum Backing Board and Coreboard and Gypsum Shaftliner Board. .................... Table 2506.2
Specification for Standard Test Methods for Physical Testing of Gypsum, Gypsum Plasters and

GypsumM CONCIELE . . . ..ottt ettt ettt e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e Table 2506.2
Test Method for Physical Testing of Gypsum Panel Products . ........ ... ... ... .. i, Table 2506.2
Test Methods for Joint Treatment Materials for Gypsum Board Construction. . . ........... ... ... ........ Table 2506.2
Specification for Joint Compound and Joint Tape for Finishing Gypsum Wallboard . ....................... Table 2506.2
Specification for Grout for Masonry. . ..............cooviiieinenn. .. 2103.12,2105.2.2.1.1,2105.2.2.1.2,2105.2.2.1.3
Specification for Marble Dimension Stone (EXterior) ............ ... ... i 2103.4
Specification for Nails for the Application of Gypsum Board ............ ... ... ... .... Table 720.1(2), Table 720.1(3),

Table 2306.4.5, Table 2506.2

Specifications for Vermiculite Loose Fill Thermal Insulation . ......... ... ... ... ... ... ...... 721.3.1.4,721.4.1.1.3
Specification for Mineral Fiber Pipe Insulation .. .......... ... ... ... ... Table 720.1(2), Table 720.1(3)
Specification for Perlite Loose Fill Insulation. . ........ .. .. . . i 721.3.1.4,721.4.1.1.3
Standard Specification for Cellular Glass Thermal Insulation. .. ......... ... ... .. Table 1508.2
Specification for Adhesives for Fastening Gypsum Wallboard to Wood Framing. . ............. ... ... .... Table 2506.2
Specification for Limestone Dimension StOne . . ... ... ... .. it 2103.4
Standard Specification for Rigid, Cellular Polystyrene Thermal Insulation. . .......... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 1508.2
Specification for Gypsum Veneer PIaster . . . ... ... .. .t Table 2507.2
Specification for Gypsum Base for Veneer Plasters . ... ... ... i Table 2507.2
Specification for Blended Hydraulic Cements . ............. ... i, Table 2103.8(1), Table 2507.2
Specification for Granite DIMension StONE . . . .. ...ttt ettt e et e e e 2103.4
Specification for Quartz DImension StONE . . . . .. ...ttt e 21034
Specification for Slate Dimension StOne . . ... ... ... .. 2103.4
Specification for Water-resistant Gypsum Backing Board . .. ... ... .. . .. Table 2506.2
Specification for Bonding Compounds for Interior Gypsum Plastering. .. ........... ... ... ... .. ... Table 2507.2
Specification for the Manufacturer, Performance and Testing of Metal Suspension Systems for

Acoustical Tile and Lay-in Panel Ceilings . .. ... ... i 803.9.1.1, 2506.2.1
Practice for Installation of Metal Ceiling Suspension Systems for Acoustical Tile and Lay-in Panels. ............. 803.9.1.1
Specification for Nonstructural Steel Framing Members. .. .......... ... ... ... . oo, Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2
Specification for Hollow Brick (Hollow Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale) ......... 1805.5.2.2,2103.2, 2105.2.2.1.1
Standard Specification for Perlite Thermal Insulation Board. ... ...... ... ... ... ... .. .. Table 1508.2
Specification for Prefaced Concrete and Calcium Silicate Masonry Units . ........... .. ... oo, 2103.1
Specification for Installation of Steel Framing Members to Receive Screw-attached

Gypsum Panel Products . . .. ... ... Table 2508.1, Table 2511.1
Specification for High-solids Content, Cold Liquid-applied Elastomeric Waterproofing Membrane for

Use with Separate Wearing COUISE . . . . ...ttt ettt e e ettt e e e e e e e e e 1507.15.2
Specification for Application and Finishing of GypsumBoard. . ......... ... ... ... ... ... .... Table 2508.1, 2509.2
Specification for Installation of Interior Lathing and Furring .. ........ ... ... ... ... ...... Table 2508.1, Table 2511.1
Specification for Application of Interior Gypsum Plaster. . .......... ... ... ... ... ...... Table 2511.1, 2511.3, 2511.4
Specification for Application of Gypsum Veneer Plaster. .. ........ ... .. ... . i Table 2511.1
Specification for Application of Gypsum Base to Receive Gypsum Veneer Plaster ......................... Table 2508.1
Specification for Metal Lath . . ... ... e Table 2507.2
Specification for Packaged, Dry Combined Materials for Surface Bonding Mortar .. ..................... 807.2.2,2103.9
Specification for Aggregate for Job-mixed Portland Cement-based Plasters. .......... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 2507.2

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 561



REFERENCED STANDARDS

C 926—98a

C 931/C 931M—04
C932—03

C 933—04

C 946—91 (2001)
C 954—00

C 955—03

C 956—04
C 957—04

C 960—04
C1002—01

C1006—84 (2001)
C1007—04

C1019—03
C1029—02
C1032—04
C1047—99
C1063—03

C 1072—00a
C1088—02
C1167—03
C1177/C1177TM—04
C1178/C1178M—04
C1186—02
C1261—04

C1278/C 1278M—03
C1280—04
C1283—03e01
C1288—01
C1289—03
C1314—03b
C1325—04
C1328—03a
C1329—04
C1386—98

C1395/1395M—04
C1396—02
C1405—00a
C1492—03

D 25—99E01

D 41—94 (2000) e01
D 43—94 (2000)
D 56—02a

D 86—04b

D 93—02a

D 225—04

D 226—97a

562

ASTM—continued

Specification for Application of Portland Cement Based-plaster . ............. ... ... ... ... .... 2109.8.4.6,2510.3,
Table 2511.1, 2511.3,2511.4, 2512.1,2512.1.2
2512.2,2512.6,2512.8.2,2512.9, 2513.7

Specification for Exterior Gypsum Soffit Board. . . ... ... ... Table 2506.2
Specification for Surface-applied Bonding Agents for Exterior Plastering . .. ................... . ... .. Table 2507.2
Specification for Welded Wire Lath . ... ... . Table 2507.2
Specification for Practice for Construction of Dry-stacked, Surface-bonded Walls . .. .................. 2103.9,2109.2.3.2

Specification for Steel Drill Screws for the Application of Gypsum Panel Products
or Metal Plaster Bases to Steel Studs from 0.033 inch (0.84 mm) to
0.112 inch (2.84 mm) in ThicKness . ... ... ..ottt Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2

Standard Specification for Load-bearing Transverse and Axial Steel Studs,
Runners Tracks, and Bracing or Bridging, for Screw Application of Gypsum Panel Products and

Metal Plaster Bases. . . ... .ot Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2
Specification for Installation of Cast-in-place Reinforced Gypsum Concrete. . ...t 1914.1
Specification for High-solids Content, Cold Liquid-applied Elastomeric Waterproofing Membrane with

Integral Wearing SUrface . . .. .. ... . e 1507.15.2
Specification for Predecorated Gypsum Board. . .. ... .. Table 2506.2
Specification for Steel Self-piercing Tapping Screws for the Application of

Gypsum Panel Products or Metal Plaster Bases to Wood Studs or Steel Studs. . .............. Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2
Test Method for Splitting Tensile Strength of Masonry Units. .. ....... .. i 2103.11.1
Specification for Installation of Load Bearing (Transverse and Axial) Steel Studs and

Related ACCESSOTIES . . o vttt e et e e e e e e e Table 2508.1, Table 2511.1
Test Method of Sampling and Testing Grout. . ..., 2105.2.2.1.1,2105.2.2.1.2,2105.2.2.1.3
Specification for Spray-applied Rigid Cellular Polyurethane Thermal Insulation . ............................ 1507.14.2
Specification for Woven Wire Plaster Base. . .. ... ... Table 2507.2
Specification for Accessories for Gypsum Wallboard and Gypsum Veneer Base................ Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2
Specification for Installation of Lathing and Furring to Receive Interior and

Exterior Portland Cement Based Plaster ... ........... ... . ... . ... ... .... 2109.8.4.6, 2510.3, Table 2511.1, 2512.1.1
Standard Text Method for Measurement of Masonry Flexural Bond Strength . . ........ ... ... ... ... ... ... 2103.11.1
Specification for Thin Veneer Brick Units Made from Clay or Shale . ............ ... ... ... i ... 2103.2
Specification for Clay ROOf Tiles. . . .. ..ot e e e e e e e e e e 1507.3.4
Specification for Glass Mat Gypsum Substrate for Use as Sheathing .. ......... ... ... .. ... ... ..... Table 2506.2
Specification for Glass Mat Water-resistant Gypsum Backing Panel. .. .......... ... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 2506.2
Specification for Flat Nonasbestos Fiber Cement Sheets. . .. ... .. ... i e 1404.10
Specification for Firebox Brick for Residential Fireplaces . .......... ... ... ... .. i .. 2111.5,2111.8
Specification for Fiber-reinforced Gypsum Panels. .. ......... .. Table 2506.2
Specification for Application of Gypsum Sheathing . .. ........... ... ... . . Table 2508.1, 2508.2
Practice for Installing Clay FIue LIiners . . .. ... ... e e e et 2113.12
Standard Specification for Discrete Nonasbestos Fiber-cement Interior Substrate Sheets .. ....................... 2509.2
Standard Specification for Faced Rigid Cellular Polyisocyanurate Thermal Insulation Board . ................ Table 1508.2
Test Method for Compressive Strength of Masonry Prisms . ........ ... ... ... ... .... 2105.2.2.2.2,2105.3.1, 2105.3.2
Standard Specification for Nonasbestos Fiber-mat Reinforced Cement Interior Substrate Sheets . ................. 2509.02
Specification for Plastic (Stucco CeMENL). . . . .. oottt e et ettt e e e e e e Table 2507.2
Specification for Mortar CEMENt . . . ... ... .ottt e e e e e Table 2103.8(1)
Specification for Precast Autoclaved Aerated Concrete (PAAC)

Wall Construction UNitS. . . ... ...ttt e e e e e 2102.1, 2103.3, 2105.2.2.1.3
Specification for Gypsum Ceiling Board . . ... ... Table 2506.2
Standard Specifications for Gypsum Wallboard . . . ... ... Table 2506.2
Standard Specification for Glazed Brick (Single Fired, Solid Brick Units). ... ........ .. .. .. 2103.2
Standard Specification for Concrete Roof Tile .. ... ... . . 1507.3.5
Specification for Round Timber Piles . ........... .. 1809.1.1,2303.1.11
Specification for Asphalt Primer Used in Roofing, Dampproofing and Waterproofing .................... Table 1507.10.2
Coal Tar Primer Used in Roofing, Dampproofing and Waterproofing ... ...... ... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Flash Point By Tag Closed TeSter . ... ... ...ttt e e 307.2
Test Method for Distillation of Petroleum Products at Atmospheric Pressure. . ......... ... ... ... i 307.2
Test Method for Flash Point By Pensky-Martens Closed Cup Tester. .. ..., 307.2
Specification for Asphalt Shingles (Organic Felt) Surfaced with Mineral Granules . ............ ... ... ... .... 1507.2.5

Specification for Asphalt-saturated Organic Felt Used in
Roofing and Waterproofing . . .......... .. 1404.2, 1507.2.3, 1507.3.3, 1507.6.3,
1507.7.3, Table 1507.8, 1507.8.3, 1507.9.3, 1507.9.4, Table 1507.10.2

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



D 227—03

D 312—00

D 422—63 (2002)

D 450—96 (2000)e01
D 635—03

D1143—81
(1994) EO1

D1227—00
D1557—02

D1586—99
D1761—388 (2000) e01
D1863—03
D1929—96 (2001)e01
D1970—01

D2166—00
D2178—97a
D2216—98
D2487—00
D2626—04
D2822—91 (97)e01
D2823—90 (97) el
D2843—99 (2004)
D2850—03a
D2898—94 (1999)
D3019—e01(Supp)

D3161—03b
D3200—74 (2000)

D3201—94 (2003)

D3278—96e01
D3462—04
D3468—99

D3679—04
D3689—90 (1995)
D3737—03
D3746—85 (2002)
D3747—79 (2000e01)
D3909—97b

D 3957—03
D4022—94 (2000)e01
D4272—03
D4318—00
D4434—04
D4479—00
D4586—00
D4601—98
D4637—04
D4829—03
D4869—04

D4897—01
D4945—00
D4990—97a
D5019—96e01

REFERENCED STANDARDS

ASTM—continued

Specification for Coal-tar-saturated Organic Felt Used in Roofing and Waterproofing ... ................. Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt Used in Roofing .. ... ... Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Particle-size Analysis of SOils. . ... ... .. 1802.3.2
Specification for Coal-tar Pitch Used in Roofing, Dampproofing and Waterproofing ..................... Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Rate of Burning and/or Extent and Time of Burning of Self-Supporting Plastics in a

Horizontal POSItION . . . . . ..o e e 2606.4
Test Method for Piles Under Static Axial Compressive Load . ........ ... . ... i, 1808.2.8.3
Specification for Emulsified Asphalt Used as a Protective Coating for Roofing ................ Table 1507.10.2, 1507.15.2
Test Method for Laboratory Compaction Characteristics of

Soil Using Modified Effort [56,000 ft-Ib/ft’ (2,700 KN m/m™)] . ... ..ot 1803.5
Specification for Penetration Test and Split-barrel Sampling of Soils . ......... .. ... i 1613.5.5
Test Method for Mechanical Fasteners in Wood . .. .............. ... 1715.1.1, 1715.1.2, 1715.1.3
Specification for Mineral Aggregate Used on Built-upRoofs. . ........ ... ... . o i Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Determining Ignition Properties of Plastics ...................... 402.15.4,406.5.2, 1407.11.2.1, 2606.4
Specification for Self-adhering Polymer Modified Bituminous Sheet Materials Used as

Steep Roof Underlayment for Ice Dam Protection. . ......... 1507.2.4,1507.2.9.2, 1507.3.9, 1507.5.6, 1507.8.7, 1507.9.8
Test Method for Unconfined Compressive Strength of Cohesive Soil ......... .. ... .. .. 1613.5.5
Specification for Asphalt Glass Felt Used in Roofing and Waterproofing .......... ... ... ... ... ..... Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Laboratory Determination of Water (Moisture) Content of Soil and Rock by Mass .. ............. 1613.5.5
Practice for Classification of Soils for Engineering Purposes (Unified Soil Classification System). . . . . Table 1610.1, 1802.3.1
Specification for Asphalt Saturated and Coated Organic Felt Base Sheet Used in Roofing. ... ..... 1507.3.3, Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt Roof Cement. . . ... ... ... Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt Roof Coatings . . ... ... ...t e Table 1507.10.2
Test for Density of Smoke from the Burning or Decomposition of Plastics ............. ... ... ... ... ... .... 2606.4
Test Method for Unconsolidated, Undrained Triaxial Compression Test on Cohesive Soils . ..................... 1613.5.5
Test Methods for Accelerated Weathering of Fire-Retardant-Treated Wood for Fire Testing . . . . . .. 1505.1, 2303.2.1, 2303.2.3
Specification for Lap Cement Used with Asphalt Roll Roofing, Nonfibered,

Asbestos Fibered and Nonasbestos Fibered. ........... .. ... .. ... . .. . Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for a Wind Resistance of Asphalt Shingles (Fan Induced Method) . ...................... 1504.1.1, 1507.2.5
Standard Specification and Test Method for Establishing Recommended Design Stresses for

Round Timber Construction Poles. . . ... ... o 2303.1.11
Test Method for Hygroscopic Properties of

Fire-retardant-treated Wood and Wood-based Products ........... ... ... ... . . .. . i 2303.2.4
Test Methods for Flash Point of Liquids by Small Scale Closed-cup Apparatus. . .. .........c..uiuniiuneennennn . 307.2
Specification for Asphalt Shingles Made from Glass Felt and Surfaced with Mineral Granules. .................. 1507.2.5
Specification for Liquid-applied Neoprene and Chlorosulfonated Polyethylene Used in

Roofing and Waterproofing .. ......... ... 1507.15.2
Specification for Rigid Poly [Vinyl Chloride (PVC) Siding] .......... ... ... ... ... . .. .. .. ... 1404.9, 1405.13
Method for Testing Individual Piles Under Static Axial Tensile Load. ..................................... 1808.2.8.5
Practice for Establishing Allowable Properties for Structural Glued Laminated Timber (Glulam) . ................ 2303.1.3
Test Method for Impact Resistance of Bituminous Roofing Systems . ............ ... . ... 1504.7
Specification for Emulsified Asphalt Adhesive for Adhering Roof Insulation............ ... ... ... ... Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt Roll Roofing (Glass Felt) Surfaced with

Mineral Granules. . ........... .. 1507.2.9.2, 1507.6.4, Table 1507.10.2
Standard Practices for Establishing Stress Grades for Structural Members Used in Log Buildings . .............. 2303.1.10
Specification for Coal Tar Roof Cement, Asbestos Containing. . ..................oov i, Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for Total Energy Impact of Plastic Films by Dart Drop. . .......... ... ... ... 1504.7
Test Methods for Liquid Limit, Plastic Limit and Plasticity Index of Soils .. .......... ... ... ... ..... 1613.5.5,1802.3.2
Specification for Poly (Vinyl Chloride) Sheet Roofing. ........ ... ... . i 1507.13.2
Specification for Asphalt Roof Coatings—Asbestos-fTee . . .. ...ttt Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt Roof Cement, ASbestos-free . . ... ... i Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Asphalt-coated Glass Fiber Base Sheet Used in Roofing .......... ... ... ... ... .... Table 1507.10.2
Specification for EPDM Sheet Used in Single-ply Roof Membrane. . .. .......... ... .. .. 1507.12.2
Test Method for Expansion Index of SOilS. . ... ... 1802.3.2
Specification for Asphalt-saturated (Organic Felt)

Underlayment Used in Steep Slope Roofing .. ............... 1507.2.3, 1507.5.3, 1507.6.3, 1507.7.3, 1507.8.3, 1507.9.3
Specification for Asphalt-coated Glass Fiber Venting Base Sheet Used in Roofing. . ..................... Table 1507.10.2
Test Method for High-strain Dynamic Testing of Piles .......... ... .. .. . i 1808.2.8.3
Specification for Coal Tar Glass Felt Used in Roofing and Waterproofing. .. ........................... Table 1507.10.2
Specification for Reinforced Nonvulcanized Polymeric Sheet Used in Roofing Membrane .. ................... 1507.12.2

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 563



REFERENCED STANDARDS

ASTM—continued

D5055—04 Specification for Establishing and Monitoring Structural Capacities of Prefabricated Wood I-Joists . .. ............ 2303.1.2
D5456—03 Specification for Evaluation of Structural Composite Lumber Products. . .............. ... ... .. . ... .. .... 2303.1.9
D5516—03 Test Method of Evaluating the Flexural Properties of Fire-retardant-

treated Softwood Plywood Exposed to the Elevated Temperatures . . ................ i, 2303.2.2.1
D5643—94 (2000)e01 Specification for Coal Tar Roof Cement, ASbestos-fIee ... .........oouuuiniiiin ... Table 1507.10.2
D5664—02 Test Methods for Evaluating the Effects of Fire-retardant Treatment and

Elevated Temperatures on Strength Properties of Fire-retardant-treated Lumber . . . .......... ... ... ....... 2303.2.2.2
D5665—99a Specification for Thermoplastic Fabrics Used in Cold-applied Roofing and Waterproofing . ............... Table 1507.10.2
D5726—98 Specification for Thermoplastic Fabrics Used in Hot-applied Roofing and Waterproofing . ................ Table 1507.10.2
D6083—97a Specification for Liquid Applied Acrylic Coating Used inRoofing . ......... ... ... ... .... Table 1507.10.2, 1507.15.2
D6162—00A Specification for Styrene Butadiene Styrene (SBS) Modified Bituminous Sheet Materials

Using a Combination of Polyester and Glass Fiber Reinforcements. . . .......... ... ... ... ..., 1507.11.2
D6163—00 EO1 Specification for Styrene-Butadiene-Styrene (SBS) Modified Bituminous Sheet Materials

Using Glass Fiber Reinforcements ... .... ... ..ot 1507.11.2
D6164—00 Specification for Styrene-Butadiene-Styrene (SBS) Modified Bituminous Sheet Metal Materials

Using Polyester Reinforcements . . ... ... . e 1507.11.2
D6222—02 Specification for Atactic Polypropylene (APP) Modified Bituminous Sheet Materials

Using Polyester Reinforcements . . . . ... ... .o 1507.11.2
D6223—02 Specification for Atactic Polypropylene (APP) Modified Bituminous Sheet Materials

Using a Combination of Polyester and Glass Fiber Reinforcements. .. .......... ... ... ... ... oo, 1507.11.2
D6298—00 Specification for Fiberglass Reinforced Styrene-Butadiene-Styrene (SBS)

Modified Bituminous Sheets with a Factory Applied Metal Surface ........... ... ... ... . .......... 1507.11.2
D6305—02e01 Practice for Calculating Bending Strength Design Adjustment Factors for Fire-retardant-treated

Plywood Roof Sheathing. ... ... ... 2303.2.2.1
D6380—01" Standard Specification for Asphalt Roll Roofing (Organic) Felt .. ....... ... ... ... ... .. 1507.2.9.2, 1507.3.3, 1507.6.4
D6381—03 Standard Test Method for Measurement of

Asphalt Shingle Mechanical Uplift Resistance . .. .......... ... ... ... oo, 1504.2.1, Table 1504.2.1, 1609.5.2
D6694—01 Standard Specification for Liquid-applied Silicone Coating Used in

Spray Polyurethane Foam Roofing ......... ... . . . . . 1507.15.2
D6754—02 Standard Specification for Ketone Ethylene Ester Based Sheet Roofing ..................... .. ... ... ..... 1507.13.2
D6757—02 Standard Specification for Inorganic Underlayment for Use with Steep Slope Roofing Products .. ................ 1507.2.3
D6841—03 Standard Practice for Calculating Design Value Treatment Adjustment Factors for

Fire-retardant-treated Lumber. . . . ... ... . 2303.2.2.2
D6878—03 Standard Specification for Thermoplastic Polyolefin Based Sheet Roofing ... ........... ... ... ............ 1507.13.2
E 72—02 Standard Test Methods of Conducting Strength Tests of Panels for Building Construction. .. ................... 2103.11.1
E 84—04 Test Methods for Surface Burning Characteristics of Building Materials .. ........ ... ... ... ... .. ... 402.10

703.4.2,719.1, 719.4, 802.1, 803.1, 803.5, 803.6.1,806.5,
1407.9, 1407.10.1, 2303.2, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.13, 2603.5.4, 2604.2.4, 2606.4, 31054

E 90—04 Test Method for Laboratory Measurement of Airborne Sound Transmission Loss of

Building Partitions and EIEMENtS . . . . ... ..o e 1207.2
E 96—00e01 Test Method for Water Vapor Transmission of Materials. ... ... .. i it 1203.2
E 108—04 Test Methods for Fire Tests of Roof Coverings. ............. .. ... 1505.1, 2603.6, 2610.2, 2610.3
E 119—00 Test Methods for Fire Tests of Building Construction and Materials. .. ........................ 410.3.5.2,703.2,703.2.1,

703.2.3,703.3, 704.7, 704.9, 706.2.1, 706.7, 711.3.2,
712.3.1,713.1,713.4,714.7,715.2,716.5.2,
716.5.3,716.6.1, 716.6.2, Table 720.1(1), 1407.10.2,
2103.2, 2603.4,2603.4.1.13,2603.5.1

E 136—99¢01 Test Method for Behavior of Materials in a Vertical Tube Furnace at 750°C . ........... .. ... ... ... ... ... 703.4.1
E 328—02 Methods for Stress Relaxation for Materials and Structures . . . ........ .. i 2103.13.6
E 330—02 Test Method for Structural Performance of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls and Doors by

Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference. .. .. ... ... . 1714.5.2
E 331—00 Test Method for Water Penetration of Exterior Windows, Skylights, Doors and Curtain Walls by

Uniform Static Air Pressure DIfference .. .. .. ... ... 1403.2
E 492—04 Test Method for Laboratory Measurement of Impact Sound Transmission Through Floor-ceiling

Assemblies Using the Tapping Machine. . .. ... ... oot e e 1207.3
E 518—03 Standard Test Methods for Flexural Bond Strength of Masonry . ........... ... .. 2101.3.11.1
E 519—02 Standard Test Method for Diagonal Tension (Shear) in Masonry Assemblages. .. ..., 2103.11.1
E 605—00 Test Method for Thickness and Density of Sprayed Fire-resistive Material (SFRM)

Applied to Structural Members .. ........... ... o o oL 1704.10.3, 1704.10.3.1, 1704.10.3.2, 1704.10.4
E 681—04 Test Methods for Concentration Limits of Flammability of Chemical Vapors and Gases. . ............. ... ........ 307.2
E 736—00 Test Method for Cohesion/Adhesion of Sprayed Fire-resistive Materials Applied to Structural Members .. ........ 1704.10.5
E 814—02 Test Method of Fire Tests of Through-penetration Firestops . . .................... 702.1,712.3.1.2,712.4.1.1,712.4.1.1.2

564 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



E 970—00

E1300—04e01

E1592—01
E1602—03
E1886—04
E1966—00
E1996—04
E 2307—04
F 547—01

F1346—91 (2003)

F1667—03

F2006—00

F2090—0la

G 152—04
G 154—00A
G 155—04

REFERENCED STANDARDS

ASTM—continued

Test Method for Critical Radiant Flux of Exposed Attic Floor Insulation Using a
Radiant Heat Energy SOUICE . . ... ... e e e e e e e e e 719.3.1

Practice for Determining Load Resistance of Glass in Buildings. .. ................... 2404.1, 2404.2, 2404.3.1, 2404.3.2,
2404.3.3, 2404.3.4,2404.3.5

Test Method for Structural Performance of Sheet Metal Roof and Siding Systems by

Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference. ....... ... .. . 1504.3.2
Guide for Construction of Solid Fuel-burning Masonry Heaters . . . ........... . i 2112.2
Test Method for Performance of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls,

Doors and Storm Shutters Impacted by Missiles and exposed to Cyclic Pressure Differentials. .. ............... 1609.1.2
Test Method for Fire-resistant JOInt SYSEMS . . . . ... ..ottt et 702.1,7.13.3
Specification for Performance of Exterior Windows, Glazed Curtain Walls, Doors and

Storm Shutters Impacted by Windborne Debris in Hurricanes. . ............. ... . ... .. ..... 1609.1.2, 1609.1.2.1
Standard Test Method for Determining Fire Resistance of Perimeter Fire Barrier Systems

Using Intermediate-scale, Multistory Test APParatus. .. .. ... ...ttt 713.4
Terminology of Nails for Use with Wood and Wood-based Materials. . ............. ... ... .. ... Table 2506.2
Performance Specification for Safety Covers and Labeling Requirements for All Covers for

Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs . . ... ... 3109.4,3109.4.1.8
Specification for Driven Fasteners: Nails, Spikes and Staples ............ ... ... ... .... Table 720.1(2), Table 720.1(3),

1507.2.6, 2303.6, Table 2506.2
Standard/Safety Specification for Window Fall Prevention Devices for

Nonemergency Escape (Egress) and Rescue (Ingress) Windows . ......... ... .. 1405.12.2
Specification for Window Fall Prevention Devices with

Emergency Escape (Egress) Release Mechanisms . ......... .. i i 1405.12.2
Practice for Operating Open Flame Carbon Arc Light Apparatus for Exposure of Nonmetallic Materials ............ 1504.6
Practice for Operating Fluorescent Light Apparatus for UV Exposure of Nonmetallic Materials ................... 1504.6
Practice for Operating Xenon Arc Light Apparatus for Exposure of Nonmetallic Materials ....................... 1504.6

AWCI

The Association of the Wall and Ceiling Industries International
803 West Broad Street, Suite 600
Falls Church, VA 22046

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
12—B—98 Technical Manual 12-B Standard Practice for the Testing and Inspection of
Field Applied This—Film Intumescent Fire-resistive Materials; an Annotated Guide, First Edition.............. 1704.11
American Wood-Preservers’ Association
AWPA &80
Grandbury, TX 76049
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
C1—00 All Timber Products—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes. .. ........ouuii i 1505.6
M4—02 Standard for the Care of Preservative-treated
WOOd Products . .. ...t 1809.1.2, 2303.1.8
Ul—04 USE CATEGORY SYSTEM: User Specification for Treated Wood Except Section 6,
Commodity Specification H . . ....... ... i 1403.5, 1505.6, Table 1507.9.5, 1805.4.5,

1805.4.6, 1805.7.1, 1809.1.2, 2303.1.8, 2304.11.2, 2304.11.4, 2304.11.6, 2304.11.7

AWS

American Welding Society
550 N.W. LeJeune Road
Miami, FL 33126

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
D1.1—04 Structural Welding Code—Steel . ... ... ... Table 1704.3, 1704.3.1, 1708.4
D1.3—98 Structural Welding Code—Sheet Steel. . ... ... e Table 1704.3
D1.4—98 Structural Welding Code—Reinforcing Steel. ........... ... ... .. .. .. . Table 1704.3, Table 1704.4

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 565



REFERENCED STANDARDS

BHMA

Builders Hardware Manufacturers’ Association
355 Lexington Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017-6603

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
A 156.10—99 American National Standard for Power Operated Pedestrian Doors .. ........... ... ... .. ... 1008.1.3.2
A 156.19—02 Standard for Power Assist and Low Energy Operated Doors. . .. ... 1008.1.3.2

Canadian General Standards Board

222 Queens Street

14th Floor, Suite 1402

Ottawa, Ontario, Canada KIA 1G6
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
37-GP-52M (1984) Roofing and Waterproofing Membrane, Sheet Applied, Elastomeric ............ ... ... ... ... ..... 1504.7, 1507.12.2
CAN/CGSB 37.54—95 Polyvinyl Chloride Roofing and Waterproofing Membrane . .......... ... .. ... i, 1507.13.2
37-GP-56M (1980) Membrane, Modified, Bituminous, Prefabricated and Reinforced for Roofing—

with December 1985 Amendment . . .. ... ..t 1507.11.2

Canadian Standards Association

5060 Spectrum Way, Suite 100

Mississauga, Ontario, L4W 5N6 Canada
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
101/1.S.2/A440—05 Specifications for Windows, Doors and Unit Skylights . ........ ... ... .. .. 1714.5.1, 2405.5

Consumer Product Safety Commission

4330 East West Highway

Bethesada, MD 20814-4408
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
16 CFR Part 1201(1977) Safety Standard for Architectural Glazing Material . ....................... 2406.1.1, 2406.2.1,2407.1, 2408.2.1, 2408.3
16 CFR Part 1209 (1979) Interim Safety Standard for Cellulose Insulation . .. ... .. e 719.6
16 CFR Part 1404 (1979) Cellulose INSULAtION. . . . ..o\ttt ettt e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 719.6
16 CFR Part 1500 (1991) Hazardous Substances and Articles; Administration and Enforcement Regulations. . ......... ... ... ... ... ..... 307.2
16 CFR Part 1500.44 (2001) Method for Determining Extremely Flammable and Flammable Solids . .......... ... ... ... ... 307.2
16 CFR Part 1507 (2001) FIrEWOTKS DEVICES . . o . o ettt et ettt e e e e e e e e e e 307.2
16 CFR Part 1630 (2000) Standard for the Surface Flammability of Carpets and Rugs. . .. ... .. . s 804.4.1

Cedar Shake and Shingle Bureau

P.O.Box 1178

Sumas, WA 98295-1178
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
CSSB—97 Grading and Packing Rules for Western Red Cedar Shakes and Western Red Shingles

of the Cedar Shake and Shingle Bureau. .......... ... ... ... ... .. ... ... ... Table 1507.8.4, Table 1507.9.5

566

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



DASMA

REFERENCED STANDARDS

Door and Access Systems Manufacturers

Association International
1300 Summer Avenue
Cleveland, OH 44115-2851

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
107—98 (03) Room Fire Test Standard for Garage Doors Using Foam Plastic Insulation . ........... ... ... ... ... ...... 2603.4.1.9

DOC

U.S. Department of Commerce

National Institute of Standards and Technology

100 Bureau Drive Stop 3460
Gaithersburg, MD 20899

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
PS-1—95 Construction and Industrial Plywood . ......... ... ... ... . . . i 2303.1.4,2304.6.2, Table 2304.7(4),

Table 2304.7(5), 2306.3.1, Table 2306.3.1, Table 2306.3.2
PS-2—92 Performance Standard for Wood-based Structural-use Panels ... ......... .. ... .. .. ... .. ... ....... 2303.1.4,2304.6.2,

Table 2304.7(5), Table 2306.3.1, 2306.3.1, Table 2306.3.2
PS 20—99 American Softwood Lumber Standard . . . .......... . . 1809.1.1, 2302.1, 2303.1.1

DOL

U.S. Department of Labor

c/o Superintendent of Documents
U.S. Government Printing Office
Washington, DC 20402-9325

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
29 CFR Part 1910.1000
(1974) AT CONLAMINANLS . . . oottt ettt ettt et e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 902.1
U.S. Department of Transportation
c/o Superintendent of Documents
D OT U.S. Government Printing Office
n Washington, DC 20402-9325
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
49 CFR—1998 TranSPOTtAtiON . . . .. oottt ettt e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 307.2
49 CFR Parts 173.137
(1990) Shippers—General Requirements for Shipments and Packaging—Class 8—Assignment of Packing Group ........... 307.2
Federal Emergency Management Agency
Federal Center Plaza
F I ‘:M q 500 C Street S.W.
Washington, DC 20472
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
FIA-TB11—01 Crawlspace Construction for Buildings Located in Special Flood Hazard Areas ... .......... ... ... ... ..... 1807.1.2.1

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

567



REFERENCED STANDARDS

'M

Factory Mutual
Standards Laboratories Department
1151 Boston-Providence Turnpike

Norwood, MA 02062
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
4450 (1989) Approval Standard for Class 1 Insulated Steel Deck Roofs—with Supplements through July 1992............... 1504.3.1,
1508.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.5
4470 (1992) Approval Standard for Class 1 ROOf COVEIS. . .. ... it e e e 1504.3.1, 1504.7
4880 (2001) American National Standard for Evaluating Insulated Wall or Wall and
Roof/Ceiling Assemblies, Plastic Interior Finish Materials, Plastic Exterior Building Panels,
Wall/Ceiling Coating Systems, Interior and Exterior Finish Systems. ................................ 2603.4, 2603.9
Gypsum Association
( : A 810 First Street N.E. #510
Washington, DC 20002-4268
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
GA 216—04 Application and Finishing of Gypsum Board. . . . ... .. .. Table 2508.1, 2509.2
GA 600—03 Fire-Resistance Design Manual, 17th Edition. . ............. ... ... ...... Table 720.1(1), Table 720.1(2), Table 720.1(3)
Hardwood Plywood Veneer Association
I I P ‘ ] A 1825 Michael Faraday Drive
Reston, VA 20190-5350
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
HP-1—2000 The American National Standard for Hardwood and Decorative Plywood . .. ...... ... ... ... ... ..... 2303.3, 2304.6.2
International Code Council, Inc.
500 New Jersey Ave, NW
I C C 6th Floor
Washington, D.C. 20001
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ICC/ANSI A117.1—03 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities . ............... . i 406.2.2,907.9.14,1007.6.5,

ICC 300—02
ICC EC—06

IECC—06
IFC—06

IFGC—06

IMC—06

568

1010.1, 1010.6.5, 1010.9, 1011.3, 1101.2, 1102.1, 1103.2.14,
1106.7, 1107.2,1108.2.2, 1109.1, 1109.2, 1109.2.1.1, 1109.2.2, 1109.3,
1109.4, 1109.8, 3001.3, 34096, 3409.8.2, 3409.8.3

ICC Standard on Bleachers, Folding and Telescopic Seating and Grandstands. ... ...................... 1025.1.1, 3401.1
ICC Electrical Code”—Administrative Provisions . ............ 101.4.1,107.3,414.5.4,415.8.2.8.1,904.3.1, 907.5, 909.11,

909.12.1, 909.16.3, 1205.4.1, 1405.10.4, 2701.1, 2701.1, 3401.3
International Energy Conservation Code”. . ... ..............cooeiiiiiiiianai.. 101.4.7, 1203.3.2, 1301.1.1, 1403.2
International Fire Code®. .. ...............ccvviriie... 101.4.6, 102.6, 201.3,307.1, 307.1.1, 307.2, Table 307.1(1),

404.2, 406.5.1, 406.6.1, 410.3.6, 411.1, 412.4.1, 413.1, 414.1.1, 414.1.2,

414.1.2.1,414.2, 414.2.5, Table 414.2.5(1), Table 414.2.5(2), 414.3, 414.5, 414.5.1,

Table 414.5.1,414.5.2,414.5.4,414.5.5,414.6,415.1,415.2, 415.3, 415.3.1, Table 415.3.1,

Table 415.3.2,415.6,415.6.1,415.6.1.4,415.6.2,415.6.2.3,415.6.2.5, 415.6.2.7, 415.6.2.8,
415.6.2.9,415.6.3,415.6.3.3.3,415.6.3.5,415.6.4,415.7,415.8.1,415.8.2.7, 415.8.5.1, 415.8.7.2,
415.8.9.3,415.8.10.1, 416.1, 420.1, 420.7, 704.8.2, 706.1, 901.2, 901.3, 901.5, 901.6.2, 903.2.6.1,

903.2.11, Table 903.2.13, 903.5, 904.2.1, 905.1,905.3.6, 906.1, 907.2.5, 907.2.12.2, 907.2.14,

907.2.16, 907.14, 907.19, 909.20, 910.2.2, Table 910.3, 1001.3, 1203.4.2, 1203.5,2702.1, 2702.2.9,

2702.2.11, 2702.2.12,2702.2.13, 2702.3, 3102.1, 3103.1, 3309.2, 3401.3, 3410.3.2, 3410.6.8.1, 3410.6.14, 3410.6.14.1

International Fuel Gas COde” . . ... ...t e 101.4.2,
201.3, Table 307.1(1), 415.6.3, 2113.11.1.2, 2113.15, 2801.1, 3401.3
International Mechanical Code®. .................. 101.4.3,201.3, 307.1, Table 307.1(1), 406.4.2, 406.6.3, 406.6.5, 409.3,

412.4.6,414.1.2,414.3,415.6.1.4,415.6.2,415.6.2.8,415.6.3,415.6.4,415.8.11.1,

416.3,420.5, 603.1, 707.2, 716.2.2, 716.5.4, 716.6.1, 716.6.2, 716.6.3, 717.5, 719.1,719.7, 903.2.12.1,
904.2.1,904.11, 908.6, 909.1, 909.10.2, 1015.5, 1017.4.1, 1203.1, 1203.2.1, 1203.4.2,

1203.4.2.1, 1203.5, 1209.3, 2304.5,2801.1, 3004.3.1, 3401.3, 3410.6.7.1, 3410.6.8, 3410.6.8.1

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



IPC—06

IPMC—06
IPSDC—06

IRC—06
IWUIC—06

SBCCI SSTD 10—99
SBCCI SSTD 11—97

REFERENCED STANDARDS

ICC—continued

International Plumbing Code® . ............................... 101.4.4,201.3,415.6.4,717.5,903.3.5,912.5, 1206.3.3,

1503.4, 1807.4.3, 2901.1, Table 2902.1, 2902.1.1, 3305.1, 3401.3
International Property Maintenance Code” .. ..................c.oviuiuenn.... 101.4.5, 102.6, 103.3, 3401.3, 3410.3.2.
International Private Sewage Disposal Code” ..ot 101.4.4,2901.1, 3401.3
International Residential Code” ................c.oiuiiriiriniono .. 101.2, 308.2, 308.3, 308.5, 310.1, 2308.1, 3401.3
International Wildland-Urban Interface Code™ . . . .. ... . .. . .. e it Table 1505.1
Standard for Hurricane Resistant Residential Construction. . ............... ... ......... 1609.1.1, 1609.1.1.1, 2308.2.1
Test Standard for Determining Wind Resistance of Concrete or Clay Roof Tiles ...................... 1715.2.1,1715.2.2

ISO

International Standards Organization
ISO Central Secretariatl, rue de Varembee, Case postale 56
CH-1211 Geneva 20, Switzerland

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ISO 8115—86 Cotton Bales—Dimensions and Density . . . .. ... .ottt e e s Table 415.8.2.1.1
National Association of Architectural
Metal Manufacturers
NAAMM G
Chicago, IL 60603
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
FP 1001—97 Guide Specifications for Design of Metal Flag Poles . ........ ... . . . 1609.1.1
National Concrete Masonry Association
N CM A 13750 Sunrise Valley Drive
Herndon, VA 22071-4662
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
TEK 5-84 (1996) Details for Concrete Masonry Fire Walls. . .. ... .o e e Table 720.1(2)
National Fire Protection Association
NFP A 1 Batterymarch Park
Quincy, MA 02169-7471
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
11—02 Low Expansion FOam . . . .. ... 904.7
12—00 Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing Systems . ... ... ... ... e 904.8, 904.11
12A—04 Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing SyStemS . . . . ..ottt e e ettt e e e e e e e 904.9
13—02 Installation of Sprinkler Systems. .. ............. it 707.2,903.3.1.1,903.3.2, 903.3.5.1.1,903.3.5.2,
904.11, 905.3.4,907.8,3104.5, 3104.9
13D—02 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-family Dwellings and
Manufactured HOMES . . . . . .o e 903.3.1.3,903.3.5.1.1
13R—02 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies Up to and
Including Four Stories in Height ... ...... .. ... ... . i 903.3.1.2,903.3.5.1.1, 903.3.5.1.2, 903.4
14—03 Installation of Standpipe and Hose System . . ..........o it 905.2, 905.3.4, 905.4.2, 905.8
16—03 Installation Foam-water Sprinkler and Foam-water Spray Systems . .. ........... it en... 904.7,904.11
17—02 Dry Chemical Extinguishing SyStems . . . . .. ..ottt e e e 904.6, 904.11
17A—02 Wet Chemical EXtinguishing SyStemS . . . .« ..ottt e e e e et e e e 904.5,904.11
30—03 Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code . . . ... ... o e 415.3
31—01 Installation of Oil-burning EQUIPMENt . . . ... .. oo e e 2113.15
32—00 Dry Cleaning PIants . . . . . ...ttt e e e e 415.6.4
40—01 Storage and Handling of Cellulose Nitrate Film. . . ... ... ..o e e 409.1
61—02 Prevention of Fires and Dust Explosions in Agricultural and Food Product Facilities. . ............. ... ... ..... 415.6.1

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 569



REFERENCED STANDARDS

72—02

80—99

85—04

92B—05
101—03
105—03
110—02
111—01
120—99
211—03
230—03
252—03
253—00

257—00
259—03
265—02

268—01

285—98

286—00

288—01

303—00
409—01
418—01
484—02
654—00

655—01
664—02
701—99

704—01
1124—03
2001—04

NFPA—continued

National Fire Alarm Code . ............. .. ... .. .. it 901.6, 903.4.1,904.3.5, 907.2, 907.2.1.1, 907.2.10,
907.2.10.4,907.2.11.2,907.2.11.3, 907.2.12.2.3, 907.2.12.3,
907.4, 907.5, 907.9.2,907.10, 907.14,907.16, 907.17, 911.1, 3006.5

Fire Doors and Fire WINAOWS . . . . . ..ot e e e e e 508.2.2.1, 7154,
715.4.5,715.4.6.1,715.4.7.2,715.5, 1008.1.3.3

Boiler and Combustion System Hazards Code .. ... ... ... . e 415.6.1

(Note: NFPA 8503 has been incorporated into NFPA 85)
Smoke Management Systems in Malls, Atria and Large Spaces . ... ... 909.8
Life Safety Code. . . . ..ottt e e e 1025.6.2
Standard for the Installation of Smoke Door Assemblies . ............... ... ... ... 405.4.2,715.4.3.1,909.20.4.1
Emergency and Standby POWer SyStems . . . ... ...ttt e 2702.1
Stored Electrical Energy Emergency and Standby Power Systems . . ............ i 2702.1
Coal Preparation Plants . . . ... ... o 415.6.1
Chimneys, Fireplaces, Vents and Solid Fuel-burning Appliances . .. ......... ... ..ttt 2112.5
Standard for the Fire Protection of StOrage. . . . ... ... ottt 507.3
Standard Methods of Fire Tests of Door Assemblies ......................... 715.3,715.4.1,715.4.2,715.4.3,715.4.4.1
Test for Critical Radiant Flux of Floor Covering Systems Using a

Radiant Heat Energy Source . ........ ...ttt 402.11.1, 406.6.4, 804.2, 804.3
Standard for Fire Test for Window and Glass Block Assemblies ......... 715.3,715.4.3.2,715.5,715.5.1,715.5.2,715.5.8.1
Test Method for Potential Heat of Building Materials . ........... .. ... ... .. 2603.4.1.10, 2603.5.3
Method of Fire Tests for Evaluating Room Fire Growth Contribution of

Textile Wall Coverings on Full Height Panelsand Walls . .. ....... . ... ... ... . i i ... 803.6.2, 803.6.2.1
Standard Test Method for Determining Ignitibility of Exterior Wall Assemblies Using a

Radiant Heat Energy Source ........... ... ... i 1406.2.1, 1406.2.1.1, 1406.2.1.2, 2603.5.7
Standard Method of Test for the Evaluation of Flammability Characteristics of

Exterior Nonload-bearing Wall Assemblies Containing Combustible Components. . ................ 1407.10.4, 2603.5.5
Standard Method of Fire Test for Evaluating Contribution of Wall and

Ceiling Interior Finish to Room Fire Growth ......... ... ... ... .. . . . 402.15.4, 803.2, 803.2.1,

803.5, 803.6.3, 2603.4, 2603.9
Standard Methods of Fire Tests of Floor Fire Door Assemblies in

Fire-resistance-rated Floor Systems. . . . ... ..ottt e 711.8,712.4.1.5
Fire Protection Standards for Marinas and Boatyards. . .. ........ .. .t 905.3.7
Aldrcraft Hangars. . . ..o 412.2.6,412.4.5
Standard for HELIPOILS . . . . ..ottt e e e e e 412.5.5
Combustible Metals, Metal Powders and Metal Dust . . ... ...t 415.6.1
Prevention of Fire & Dust Explosions from the Manufacturing, Processing and Handling of

Combustible Particulate SOLids . ...... ... 415.6.1
Prevention of Sulfur Fires and EXpPIOSIONS. . . . . . ..ottt 415.6.1
Prevention of Fires Explosions in Wood Processing and Woodworking Facilities. .. .......... ... ... ... .. ... 415.6.1
Standard Methods of Fire Tests for Flame-propagation of

Textilesand Films. ... .o o o i i i 402.11.1, 410.3.6, 801.1.2, 806.1, 806.1.2, 806.2,

3102.3,3102.3.1,3102.6.1.1, 3105.4
Standard System for the Identification of the Hazards of Materials for Emergency Response . . .............. 414.7.2,415.2
Manufacture, Transportation, and Storage of Fireworks and Pyrotechnic Articles. ... ......... ... ... ... ...... 415.3.1
Clean Agent Fire EXtinguishing SyStemsS . . . . ... oottt e e e e e e 904.10

PCI

Precast Prestressed Concrete Institute
209 W. Jackson Boulevard, Suite 500
Chicago, IL 60606-6938

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
MNL 124—89 Design for Fire Resistance of Precast Prestressed CONCIEte. . . . ..o vv vttt et 721.2.3.1
MNL 128—01 Recommended Practice for Glass Fiber Reinforced Concrete Panels .. ........ ... .. ... ... .. 1903.2

570

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



PTI

Post-Tensioning Institute
1717 W. Northern Avenue, Suite 114

REFERENCED STANDARDS

Phoenix, AZ 85021
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
PTI—2004 Standard Requirements for Analysis of Shallow Concrete Foundations on Expansive

Soils, First EAItON . . . . .o o e e e e 1805.8.2
PTI—2004 Standard Requirements for Design of Shallow Post-tensioned Concrete Foundation on
EXpansive SIS . ..o .. e 1805.8.2

Rack Manufacturers Institute
RMI 8720 Red Oak Boulevard, Suite 201

Charlotte, NC 28217
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
RMI (2002) Specification for Design, Testing and Utilization of Industrial Steel Storage Racks.............................. 2208.1

Steel Joist Institute
S I 3127 10th Avenue, North

Myrtle Beach, SC 29577-6760
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
JG-1.1—05 Standard Specification for JOist GIirders . . . ... ... ...t 1604.3.3, 2206.1
K-1.1—05 Standard Specification for Open Web Steel Joists, K-Series .. ..............o ... 1604.3.3, 2206.1

LH/DLH-1.1—05

Standard Specification for Longspan Steel Joists, LH Series and Deep Longspan Steel Joists,
DLH SIS . . . oottt e

.............. 1604.3.3, 2206.1

Single-Ply Roofing Institute

77 Rumford Ave.
SPRI il

Walthem, MA 02453
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ES-1—03 Wind Design Standard for Edge Systems Used with Low Slope Roofing Systems. .......... ... ... ... ... ..... 1504.5
RP-4—02 Wind Design Guide for Ballasted Single-ply Roofing Systems. .. ... 1504.4

Telecommunications Industry Association
TI q 2500 Wilson Boulevard

Arlington, VA 22201-3834
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number

TIA/EIA-222-F—96

Structural Standards for Steel Antenna Towers and Antenna Supporting Structures. . . ......

............. 1609.1.1, 3108.4

T™S

The Masonry Society
3970 Broadway, Unit 201-D
Boulder, CO 80304-1135

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
0216—97 Standard Method for Determining Fire Resistance of Concrete and Masonry Construction

ASSEMDIICS . .« ot

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

.......... Table 720.1(2), 721.1

571



REFERENCED STANDARDS

402—05

602—05

TMS—continued

Building Code Requirements for Masonry Structures. . .............. 1405.5, 1405.5.2, 1405.9, 1604.3.4, 1704.5, 1704.5.1,
Table 1704.5.1, 1704.5.2, 1704.5.3, Table 1703.4.5.3, 1708.1.1,

1708.1.2, 1708.1.3,1708.1.4, 1805.5.2, 1812.7,2101.2.2, 2101.2.3,

2101.2.4,2101.2.5,2101.2.6, 2103.13.6, 2106.1, 2106.1.1, 2106.1.1.1,

2106.1.1.2,2106.1.1.3, 2106.3, 2106.4, 2106.5, 2106.6, 2107.1, 2107.2,2107.3,

2107.4,2107.5,2107.6,2107.7, 2107.8,2108.1, 2108.2,2108.3, 2108.4, 2109.1, 2109.2.3.1,2109.7.3

Specification for Masonry Structures. . ............c..oouuiennaon.. 1405.5.1, Table 1704.5.1, Table 1704.5.3, 2103.13.7,
2104.1,2104.1.1,2104.3,2104.4

TPI

Truss Plate Institute
583 D’Onofrio Drive, Suite 200

Madison, WI 53719
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
TPI 1—2002 National Design Standards for Metal-plate-connected Wood Truss Construction. . . ..................... 2303.4.2, 2306.1
Underwriters Laboratories, Inc.
UL 333 Pfingsten Road
Northbrook, IL 60062-2096
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
10A—98 Tin Clad Fire Doors—with Revisions through March 2003. . .. ... ... . i 715.4
10B—97 Fire Tests of Door Assemblies—with Revisions through October 2001. .. ....... ... ... ... .. ... 7154.2
10C—98 Positive Pressure Fire Tests of Door Assemblies—with Revisions through November 2001 ............... 715.4.1,7154.3
14B—98 Sliding Hardware for Standard Horizontally Mounted Tin Clad Fire Doors—
with Revisions through July 2000. . . . .. ... 715.4
14C—99 Swinging Hardware for Standard Tin Clad Fire Doors Mounted Singly andin Pairs . ............................. 715.4
94—96 Test for Flammability of Plastic Materials for Parts in Devices and Appliances . ................. oo . 402.11.1
103—01 Factory-built Chimneys, for Residential Type and Building Heating Appliances. . . ........... ... ... .. oooo... 717.2.5
127—96 Factory-built Fireplaces—with Revisions through November1999............ ... ... ... ... ... ... ... 717.2.5,2111.11
199E—04 Outline of Investigation for Fire Testing of Sprinklers and Water Spray Nozzles for Protection of
Deep Fat Fryers . . ..o 904.11.4.1
217—97 Single and Multiple Station Smoke Alarms—with revisions through January 2004 . .......... ... ... ......... 907.2.10
268—96 Smoke Detectors for Fire Protective Signaling Systems—with Revisions through January 1999............ 407.6,907.2.6.2
300—96 Fire Testing of Fire Extinguishing Systems for Protection of Restaurant Cooking Areas —
with Revisions through December 1998. . . . ... . . 904.11
555—99 Fire Dampers—with Revisions through January 2002. . . .. ... .. e e e 716.3
555C—96 Ceiling DamPeTS . . . . oottt e 716.3,716.6.2
5558—99 Smoke Dampers—with Revisions through January 2002 ... ...... ... ... .. ... i 716.3,716.3.1.1
580—94 Test for Uplift Resistance of Roof Assemblies—with Revisions through February 1998 ................ 1504.3.1, 1504.3.2
641—95 Type L Low-temperature Venting Systems—with Revisions through April 1999........ ... ... ... ... ..... 2113.11.1.4
710B—2004 Recirculating SYSteIMS. . . . o ..ottt et e e e e e 904.11
790—98 Tests for Fire Resistance of Roof Covering Materials—with Revisions through July 1998................. 1505.1, 2603.6,
2610.2,2610.3
793—97 Standard for Automatically Operated Roof Vents for Smokeand Heat .......... ... ... ... ... ... ... ...... 910.3.1
864—03 Standard For Control Units and Accessories for Fire Alarm Systems—
with Revisions through October 2003. . . . ... ... e e 909.12
1040—96 Fire Test of Insulated Wall Construction—with Revisions through April 2001 .. ................ 1407.10.3, 2603.4, 26039
1256—02 Fire Test of Roof Deck ConStrucCtion. . .. ...ttt et e e e 1508.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.5
1479—94 Fire Tests of Through-penetration Fire stops—
with Revisions through August 2000. . ........ ... e 712.3.1.2,712.4.1.1.2,712.5
1482—98 Solid-fuel Type Room Heater—with Revisions through January 2000. . ......... ... ... ... ... ... .... 2112.2,2112.5
1715—97 Fire Test of Interior Finish Material—with Revisions through October 2002 .......... 1407.10.2, 1407.10.3, 2603.4, 26039
1777—04 Chimney Liners—with Revisions through July 1998. .. .. ... ... ... . .. .. . . . 2113.11.1, 2113.19
1784—95 Air Leakage Tests of Door Assemblies. . ........... ... ... ... ...... 707.14.1,710.5.2,715.4.3.1,715.4.5.1,715.4.5.3
1897—98 Uplift Tests for Roof Covering Systems—with Revisions through November 2002 . ........................... 1504.3.1
1975—96 Fire Test of Foamed Plastics Used for Decorative Purposes . .......... ... ... ... ... ...... 402.10, 402.11.1, 402.15.5
2017—2000 Standard for General-purpose Signaling Devices and Systems—with Revisions through June 2004.............. 3109.4.1.8
572 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®



2079—98
2200—98
2390—04

Tests for Fire Resistance of Building Joint Systems
Stationary Engine Generator Assemblies.

(Revisions through July 2004)

Test Method for Measuring the Wind Uplift Coefficients for Asphalt Shingles

UL—continued
............................................. 702.1,713.3,713.6
.............................................................. 2702.1.1

REFERENCED STANDARDS

........................ 1504.2.1, 1609.5.2

ULC

Underwriters Laboratories of Canada

7 Crouse Road

Scarborough, Ontario, Canada M1R3A9

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
CAN/ULC S102.2—

1988 Standard Method of Test for Surface Burning Characteristics of Flooring,

Floor Coverings and Miscellaneous Materials and Assemblies with 2000 Revisions . ........................... 719.4

USC

United States Code

c/o Superintendent of Documents
U.S. Government Printing Office
Washington, DC 20402-9325

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
18 USC Part 1, Ch.40 Importation, Manufacture, Distribution and Storage of Explosive Materials. . ......... .. ... ... ... .. .......... 307.2
Window and Door Manufacturers Association
WDM A 1400 East Touhy Avenue #470
Des Plaines, IL 60018
Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number

101/1.S.2/A440—05

Specifications for Windows, Doors and Unit Skylights

............................................ 1714.5.1, 2405.5

WRI

Wire Reinforcement Institute, Inc.
203 Loudon Street, S.W.

2nd Floor, Suite 203C

Leesburg, VA 22075

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
WRI/CRSI—81 Design of Slab-on-ground Foundations—with 1996 Update. . .. .......... .t 1805.8.2
2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE® 573



574 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®





